




































































Ch.1,Pg. 24 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

a back-up unlocking operation, in the event of failure of the primary
release mechanism.

Section 1008.4 Registration, Annual Inspection and Certification of
Hardware-Added. After January 1, 2008 all annual fire alarm inspections shall include
the registration of access-controlled egress door hardware installed in accordance with
Section 1008.1.3.4 of the ICC International Building Code, 2006 Edition, as adopted by the
City of Tulsa, delayed egress locks installed in accordance with Section 1008.1.8.6 of the
ICC International Building Code, 2006 Edition, as adopted by the City of Tulsa, and
fail-safe electronic locks installed in accordance with Section 1008.1.8.8 of the ICC
International Building Code, 2006 Edition, as adopted by the City of Tulsa, shall be
registered with the City of Tulsa. Such installations shall pass annual inspections by and
shall be certified by an approved alarm company. A record of the inspections shall be
submitted to the fire code official annually. The schedule for registration of these
specific three (3) sets of hardware shall be in accordance with the following priority
phasing:

1. Any such hardware currently installed on doors opening into an exit stair
or elevator lobby including public access corridors connected to these exits and lobbies.

2. All proposed new construction and remodeling permit applications,
including existing hardware in remodeled spaces.

3. After completion of licensing and registration of hardware company by the
State and the City of Tulsa, all new hardware installation, and all hardware not currently
registered at time of repair or maintenance of that hardware.

Exception: Registration, inspection, and certification shall not be required for
door hardware of single-occupant spaces.

1014.2.1 Multiple Tenants-Amendatory. Where more than one (1) tenant occupies
any one (1) floor of a building or structure, each tenant space, dwelling unit and sleeping
unit shall be provided with access to the required exits without passing through adjacent
tenant spaces, dwelling units and sleeping units.

Exceptions:

1. Means of egress shall not be prohibited through adjoining tenant space
where such rooms or spaces occupy less than ten percent (10%) of the area
of the tenant space through which they pass, are the same or similar
occupancy group, a discernible path of egress travel to an exit is provided,
and the means of egress into the adjoining space is not subject to locking
from the egress side. A required means of egress serving the larger tenant
space shall not pass through the smaller tenant space or spaces.



Ch.1,Pg. 25 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

2. Means of egress to the required second exit through another tenant space
shall not be prohibited in buildings permitted prior to October 27, 1972.

3. Existing means of egress through another tenant space, approved on or
after October 27, 1972 and prior to January 1, 2008, shall be permitted to
remain. Newly created means of egress through another tenant space shall
not be permitted in buildings permitted on or after October 27, 1972.

1019.1 Minimum Number of Exits-Amendatory. All rooms and spaces within
each story shall be provided with and have access to the minimum number of approved
independent exits required by Table 1019.1 of the ICC International Building Code, 2006
Edition, as adopted by the City of Tulsa, based upon the occupant load of the story,
except as modified in Sections 1015.1 or 1019.2 of the ICC International Building Code, 2006
Edition, as adopted by the City of Tulsa. For the purposes of this chapter, occupied roofs
shall be provided with exits as required for stories. The required number of exits from
any story, basement or individual space shall be maintained until arrival at grade or the
public way, except that an elevator lobby, stair lobby, basement, or occupied roof area,
in compliance with Table 1015.1 of the ICC International Building Code, 2006 Edition, as
adopted by the City of Tulsa, and that does not exceed 735 square feet in size, shall be
permitted to be a single exit or single exit access space. Such single exit or single exit
access lobbies shall be subject to correction for exit or exit access being provided if future
International Code Council code development or written interpretation regarding and
clarifying lobby egress become available..

1027.5 Ilumination Emergency Power-Amendatory. The power supply for means
of egress illumination shall normally be provided by the premises’ electrical supply. In
the event of power supply failure, illumination shall be automatically pr’ovided from an
emergency system for the following occupanc1es where such occupancies require two
or more means. of egress:

1. Group A having fifty (50) or more occupants.
2. Group B buildings three (3) or more stories in height, buildings with one
hundred (100) or more occupants above or below the level of exit discharge, or buildings

with 1,000 or more total occupants.

3. Group E in interior stairs, corridors, windowless areas with student
occupancy, shops and laboratories.

4, Group F having more than one hundred (100) occupants.
Exception: Buildings used only during daylight hours which are provided

with windows for natural light according to the International Building
Code.



Ch.1,Pg 26 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

5. Group L
6. Group M.

Exception: Buildings less than 3,000 square feet (279 m 2) in gross sales
area on one (1) story only, excluding mezzanines.

7. Group R-1.

Exception: Where each guestroom has direct access to the outside of the
building at grade.

8. Group R-2 as applicable in Section 1001.1 of this code.

Exception: Where each living unit has direct access to the outside of the
building at grade.

9. Group R-4.

Exception: Where each sleeping room has direct access to the outside of
the building at ground level.

The emergency power system shall provide power for not less than sixty (60) minutes
and consist of storage batteries, unit equipment or an on-site generator. The installation
of the emergency power system shall be in accordance with Section 604 of this code.

2701.5 Permits-Amendatory. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections
105.6 and 105.7 of this code. When required by the fire code official, permittees shall
apply for approval to permanently close a storage, use or handling facility. Such an
application shall be submitted at least thirty (30) days prior to the termination of the
storage, use or handling of hazardous materials. The fire code official is authorized to
require that the application be accompanied by an approved facility closure plan in
accordance with Section 2701.6.3 of this code.

3301.1.3 Fireworks-Amendatory. It shall be unlawful and a misdemeanor offense
for any person to possess, manufacture, store, sell, handle or use any fireworks within
the corporate limits of the City of Tulsa, without first having procured an operational
permit from the fire code official, as required by Section 3301.2 of this code. The
operational permit fee shall be as provided in Title 49, Tulsa Revised Ordinances,
Chapter 14.

3301.2.4 Financial Responsibility-Amendatory. Before an operational permit is
issued, as required by Section 3301.2 of this code, the applicant shall file with the City
Clerk of the City of Tulsa a corporate surety bond in the principal sum of $3,000,000 or



Ch. 1, Pg. 27 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

certificate of insurance evidencing a public liability insurance policy for the same
amount, for the purpose of the payment of all damages to persons or property which
arise from, or are caused by, the conduct of any act authorized by the permit upon
which any judicial judgment results. The fire code official is authorized to specify a
greater or lesser amount when, in the fire code official's opinion, conditions at the
location of use indicate a greater or lesser amount is required. Government entities shall
be exempt from this bond requirement.

3308.11 Retail Display and Sale-Deleted. Section 3308.1.1 of the ICC International
Fire Code, 2006 Edition is intentionally deleted from this code.

3901.1 Scope-Amendatory. The storage and use of organic peroxides shall be in
accordance with this chapter, Chapter 27 and National Fire Protection Association (NFPA)
Standard Reference Number 432 listed in Chapter 45 of this code. Unclassified detonable
organic peroxides that are capable of detonation in their normal shipping containers
under conditions of fire exposure shall be stored in accordance with Chapter 33 of this
code.

Chapters 45-Amendatory. Within the ICC International Fire Code, 2006 Edition
Chapter 45, Reference Standards, the reference standard of the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA), is amended to read as follows:

National Fire Protection Association

1 Batt h Park
NFPA e a2

Standard
reference
number Title Referenced in code section number
1-06 Uniform Fire Code ... vivetiininimiinneeanieananananann, 2301.1, 2308.4, 2310.1, 2501.1, 3404.3.39
10-07 Portable Fire Extinguishers ., ...v.,,.«.. Table 901.6.1, 906.2, 906.3, Table 906.3(1), Table 906.3(2), 2106.3
11-05 Low- Medium-, High- Expansion.Foam Systems ...........cooivivnnn.. e e 904.7, 3404.2.9.1.2
1205 Carbon Dioxide Extinguishing SYstems ... i.iiinveiiniiienirvranennsnn Table 901.6.1, 904.8, 904.11
12A-04 Halon 1301 Fire Extinguishing Systems . ......cniuinvi i ieiiinieeniieon, Table 901.6.1, 904.9
13-07 Installation of Sprinkler Systems ... ..........i .00, Table 704.1, 903.3.1.1, 903.3.2, 903.3.5.1.1, 903.3.5.2,
904.11,905.3.4, 907.9,2301.1, 2304.2, Table 2306.2, 2306.9, 2307.2,
2307.2.1, 2308.2.2., 2308.2.2.1, 2310.1, 2501.1,2804.1, 2806.5.7,
3404.3.3.9, Table 3404.3.6.3(7), 3404.3.7.5.1, 3404.3.84
13D-07 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings
and Manufactured HOmes .. ... .0t ittt it it ittt et e 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1
13R-07 Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Residential Qccupancies
up to and Including Four Stories in Height ..................0.n. 903.1.2, 903.3.5.1.1, 903.3.5.1.2, 903.4
1407 Installation of Standpipe, Private Hydrants and Hose Systems .. ....c...ovvves 905.2, 905.3.4, 905.4.2, 905.8°
1507 Water Spray Fixed Systems for Fire Protection . .........ccovininiiin s e, e 3404.2.9.1.3
16-03 Installation of Foam-Water Sprinkler and Foam-Water Spray Systems ..........coouune.n .. 904.7, 904.11
17-02 Dry Chemical Extinguishing Systems . .. ....... ... vt iiiiiiiiiiinaian, Table 901.6.1, 904.6, 904.11
17A-02 Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems ... ... ... . it i i Table 901.6.1, 904.5, 904.11
20-07 Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection . ..............coiaiiiiiiin.., 913.1, 913.2, 91351
22-03 Water Tanks for Private Fire Protection . ... ... ittt ittt 508.2.2

24-07 Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and their Appurtenances ........... ... 0.ua.es 508.2.1, 1909.5




Ch.1,Pg. 28

Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

NFPA

National Fire Protection Association
1 Batterymarch Park

Quincy, MA 02269
Standard
reference
number Title Referenced in code section number
25-02 Inspection, Testing and Maintenance of Water-Based
Fire Protection SYSIEMS .« .« oot vvve v vicnvibinennmriviiaias 508.5.3, Table 901.6.1, 904.7.1, 912.6, 913.5
30-03 Flammable and Combustible Liquids Code .., ................. 3403.6.2, 3403.6.2.1, 3404.2.7, 3404.2.7.1,
3404:2.7.2, 3404.2.7.3.6, 3404.2.7 4, 3404.2.7.6, 3404.2.7.7, 3404.2.7.8,
3404.2.7.9, 3404.2.9.2, 3404.2.9.3, 3404.29.5.1.1, 3404.29.5.1.2, 3404.2.9.5.1.3,
3404.2.9.5.14, 3404.2.9.5.1.5, 3404.2.9.5.2, 3404.2.9.6.4; 3404.2.10.2, 3404.2.11.4,
3404.2.11.5.2, 3404.2.12.1, 3404.3.1, 3404.3.6, 3404.3.7.2.3, 3404.3.7.5.1 3404.3.8.4, 3406.8.3
30A-03 Code for Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities.and Repair Garages .....: 22014, 2201.5, 2201.6, 2206.6.3, 2210.1
308-07 Manufacture and Storage of Aerosol Products ........... . covn 2801.1, 2803.1, 2804.1, Table 2804.3.1,
' Table 2804.3.2, Table 2804.3.2.2, 2804.4.1, 2804.5.2, 2804.6,
Table 2806.2; 2806.2.3, 2806.3.2, Table 2806.4,
2806.5.1,2806.5.6, 2807.1
31-06 Installation of Oil-Burning EQUipMent . ....c.ueeuvnvntinuriveeriarennnnnns 603.1.7, 603.3.1,603.3.3
32-07 Dry-cleaning PIants .. ..ot et iiiia o e s s s ce e one o 1207.1, 1207.3
3307 Spray Application Using Flammable or Combustible Materials ............ ... ... ..ol 1504.3.2
34-07 Dipping and Coating Processes Using Flammable or Combustible Liquids ............. 1505.3, 1505.4.1.1
35-05 Manufacture of Organic Coatings .. .ovvvus i irnnn e erreeinrancnariesasnosaeanssn 2001.3, 20054
40-07 Storage and Handling of Cellulose Nitrate Motion Picture Film . .. .o ... i iin e, 306.2
51-02 Design and Installation of Oxygen-Fuel Gas Systems for Welding, Cutting,
and Aled PrOCESSES . .. oot vean sttt e s e e s s e e e 2601.5, 2607.1, 2609.1
51A-06 Acetylene Cylindetr Charging Plants. ...+ .. ivuvn e vinivivrviivneennn e sesaacrasnsns PPN 2608.1
52-06 Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) Vehicular Fuel Systems and
Liquefied Natural Gas (LNG) Vehicular Fuel Systems. ... ... iuioriinniiinrioiaiiiviiennans 3001.1
55-05 Standard for the storage, Use and Handling of Compressed Gases and
Cryogenic Fluids in Portable and Stationary Containers, Cylinders, and Tanks 2209.2.1, 3201.1, 3501.1, 4001.1
58-04 Liquefied Petroleum GasCode ............... ..., 3801.1, 3803.1, 3803.2.1, 3803.2.1.2, 3803.2.1.7, 3803.2.2,
3804.1, 3804.3.1, 3804.4, 3806.2, 3806.3, 3807.2, 3808.1, 3808.2, 3809.11.2, 3811.3
59A-06 Production, Storage and Handling of Liquefied Natural Gas (ING) ... ......o.v iivian. . 3001.1, 3201.1
61-02 Prevention of Fires and Dust Explosions in Agricultural and Food Products Facilities . ........ Table 1304.1
69-02 Explosion Prevention SYstems ... ....unviinasiiviiiviinerinivsiaiaears 911.1,911.3, Table 1304.1
70-05 National Electrical Code .............. 603.13, 603.1.7,:603.5.2, 604.2.16.1, 604:2.162, 605.1, 605.3, 6054,
605.9, 606.16, 904.3.1, 907.6, 909.11, 909.12.1, 909.16.3, 1106.34,
1204.2.3, Table 1304.1, 1404.7, 1503.2.1, 1503.2.1.1, 1503.2.1.4, 1503.2.5,
1504.6.1.2.2, 1504.9.4, 1604.5, 1703.2.1,°1803.7.1, 1803.7.2, 1803.7.3,
19034, 2004.1, 2201.5, 22054, 2208.8.1.2.4, 2209.2.3, 2211.3.1, 2211.8.1.24,
2403.12.6.1, 2404.15.7, 26064, 2703.7.3, 2703.8.7.1, 2703.9.4, 2704.7,
2705.1.5,.3003.7.6, 3003.8, 3003.16.11, 3003.16.14, 3203.7, 3203.7.2, 3403.1,
Table 3403.1.1, 3403.1.3, 3404.2.8.12, 3404.2.8.17, 3406.2.8,3503.1.5,
3503.1.5.1, 3606.5.5, 3606.5.6, 3704.2.2.8
72-07 National Fire Alarm Code ........ .. vnnns 509.1, Table 901.6.1, 903.4.1, 904.3.5, 907.2, 907.2.1.1, 907.2.10,
907.2.104, 907.2.11.2, 907.2.11.3, 907.2.12.2.3, 907.2.12.3; 907.3, 907.5,
907.6, 907.10.2, 907.11, 907.15, 907.17, 907.18, 907.20, 907.20.2, 907.20.5
80-07 Fire Doors and Fire Windows .. .. ... on e ivias P S i e s e 703.2, 1008.1.3.3
85-04 Boiler and Combustion System Hazards Code . ... ... it iiiiiiannn Table 1304.1
{Note:'NFPA 8503 has been incorporated into NFPA 85)
86-07 Ovens.and FUIMACES , «.vrvnnennrirnneeniaernanneens s e e e s e e e e 21011
92B-05 Smoke Management Systems in Malls, Atria and Large < T S P 909.8
99-05 Health Care Facilities ........ ..o it iiiniiiineenn b e e e 3006.4
101-06 LifeSafety Code «....covuniinanonns S e i e N 1025.6.2
110-05 Emergency and Standby Power Systems . .. ........oviii ety 604.1, 604.3, 604.4, 913.5.2, 9135.3
11105 Stored Electrical Energy Emergency and Standby Power Systems ................. .. 604.1, 604.3,604.4
120-04 Coal Preparation Plants . ... ..o vt i it iiia et rae s - Table 1304.1
160-06 Flame Effects Before an Audience ........ ..o ciiinun ... D Tt 308.3.6




Ch.1,Pg 29 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)

National Fire Protection Association

NFPA i

Standard
reference
number Title Referenced in code section number
211-06 Chimneys, Fireplaces, Vents and Solid Fuel-Burning Appliances ...........coviiiiivininivavns 603.2
241-04 Safeguarding Construction, Alteration, and Demolition Operations ...... B N 14011
260-03 Methods. of Tests and Classification System for Cigarette Ignition
Resistance-of Components of Upholstered Furniture ............ ... ... ... 805.1.1.1,805.2.1.1,805.3.1.1
261-03 Method of Test for Determining Resistance of Mock-Up Upholstered
Furniture Material Assemblies to Ignition by Smoldering Cigarettes . ................. 805.2.1.1,805.3.1.1
265-07 Standard Method of Fire Tests for Evaluating Room Fire Growth Contribution
of Textile Wall COVEFINGS « ..o\ vvnir it ieeio e ciar e cienanses 803.5.1, 803.5.1.1,803.5.1.2
286-06 Standard Method of Fire Tests for Evaluating Contnbutxon of
Wall and Ceiling Initerior Finish to Room Fire Growth .. ............ <, .+. . 803.1,803.1.2,803.1.2.1,803.5.1
303-06 Fire Protection Standard for Marinas and Boatyards ..................... e 905.3.7
385-00 Tank Vehicles for Flammable and Combustible Liquids . ................. ... 3406.5.4.5, 3406.6, 3406.6.1
407-07 Aircraft Fuel Servicing . ......... e et 1106.2, 1106.3
409-04 Alrcraft Hangars, . ....uviinotiiivnsivneinmmevonseeniiiossessrrianesisrenses . 914.8.2,914.8.5
430-04 Storage of Liquid and Solid Oxidizers ........... oot iiaiiiineiriiinireanrena, 4004.1.4
432-02 Organic Peroxide Formulations, Storage of .. ... ... oo i it e e 39011
484-06 Combustible Metals, Metal Powders, and Metal DUusts . . ... .. civiiimnienimrveiaionasens Table 1304.1
490-02 Storage of Ammonium Nitrate .. ... ..o i iivn i i e 3301.1.5
495-06 Explosive Materials Code ........ 911.1, 911.4, 3301:1.1, 3301.1.5, 3302.1, 3304.2, 3304.6.2, 3304.6.3, 3304.7.1,
3305.1, 3306.1, 3306.5.2.1, 3306.5.2.3, 3307.1, 3307.9, 3307.11,.3307.15
498-06 Safe Havens and Interchange Lots for Vehicles Transporting Explosives . ....... ... .o iontt, 3301.1.2
505-06 Powered Industrial Trucks, Including Type Designations,
Areas of Use, Maintenance, and Operation .. ......uviviviaivenieeinemeareivivesecnasiin 2703.7.3
654-06 Prevention of Fire and Dust Explosions from the Manufacturing, Processing and Handling of
Combustible Particulate Solids ................. S P PPN - . Table 1304.1
655-07 Prevention of Sulfur Fires and Explosions: . ... .c.co iyt or s iiinsans + ... Table 1304.1
664-07 Prevention of Fires and Explosions in' Wood Processing and Woodworking Facilities . .. Table 1304.1, 1905.3
701-04 Standard Methods of Fire Tests for Flame-Propagation of Textiles
andFilms .. .. i e 806.2, 807.1, 807.1.2, 807.2, 807.4.2.2, 1703.5
703-06 Fire Retardant Impregnated Wood and Fire Retardant Coatings for Building Materials .+ .. ... ..o, 803.4
704-07 Identification of the Hazards of Materials for Emergency Response . .... -+ ... 606.7, 1802.1, 2404.2 2703.2.2.1,
2703.2.2.2, 2703.5, 2703.10.2, 2705.1.10,
2705.2.1.1, 2705.4.4, 32034.1, 3404.2.3.2
750-06 Standard-on Water Mist Fire Protection Systems . ..........coiiiiiiiniiia.s. N Table 901.6.1
1122-02 MOl ROCKEEY « « + « e iivin s v e s e s eee s b aee s it e e s o s e ben ne freaan s s 3301.1.4
1123-06 Fireworks Display . ... ... ..o it iiii i 3302.1, 3304:2, 3308.1, 3308.2.2, 3308.5, 3308.6
1124-06 Manufacture, Transportation, Storage and Retail Sales of Fireworks
and Pyrotechnic Articles . ... ... .o 3302.1, 3304.2, 3305.1, 3305.3, 3305.4, 3305.5
1125-01 Manufacture of Model Rocket and High Power Rocket Motors .......cvevvrinviviin i 3301.1.4
1126-06 Use of Pyrotechnics Before a Proximate Audience ........... 3304.2, 3305.1, 3308 1 3308.2.2, 33084, 3308.5
1127-02 High Power RocKelry . .o o iv i e i e s et et b e s ine s 3301.14
200104 Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems ... ... .cociiiiniiiiiniinnennninenas Table 901.6.1, 504.10

Appendix A-Deleted. Appendix A of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition,
entitled "Board of Appeals" is intentionally deleted from this code.

Appendices B through G-Added. The following appendices of the International
Fire Code, 2006 Edition, are specifically referred to, adopted and made a part of this code,
as if fully set out in this chapter, with the amendments thereto:



Ch. 1, Pg. 30 Title 14 - Fire Prevention Supp. 18 (7/1/08)
APPENDIX B FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

APPENDIX C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION

APPENDIX D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

APPENDIX E HAZARD CATEGORIES

APPENDIX F HAZARD RANKING

APPENDIX G CRYOGENIC FLUIDS-WEIGHT AND VOLUME EQUIVALENTS

Appendix D-Amendatory. Appendix D of the International Fire Code, 2006 Edition,
Figure D103.4, entitled Requirements for Dead-End Fire

entitled Fire Apparatus Access Roads,
Apparatus Access Roads is amended

in this code, to appear as follows:

TABLE D103.4-Amendatory
REQUIREMENTS FOR DEAD-END FIRE
APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

TURNAROUNDS REQUIRED

None required

120-foot Hammethead, 60-foot "Y" or 76-foot-diameter
paved cul-de-sac in accordance with the Subdivision
Regulations for the Tulsa Metropolitan Area

120-foot Hammerhead, 60-foot "Y" or 80-foot-diameter
paved cul-de-sac in accordance 'with the Subdivision
Regulations for the Tulsa. Metropolitan Area

120-foot Hammerhead, 60-foot "Y" or 96-foot-diameter
paved cul-de-sac iri accordance with the Subdivision
Regulations for the Tulsa Metropolitan Area

LENGTH | WIDTH
(Feel) {Feet)

0-150 20

151-250 |20

251-500 20

501-750 26

Qver 750 S

pecial approval required

Ord. No. 20044, 20625, 20824, 21281, 21805




