
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department IFB 19-907 Buyer: Donny Tiemann
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Signal Head Maintenance Equipment dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Streets & Stormwater Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: May 30, 2019

1. Delivery: 

If your Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price Unit Unit Price

1 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#36) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $295.00 Each NO BID

2 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#54L) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $295.00 Each NO BID

3 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#54R) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $295.00 Each NO BID

4 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#36) (Louvered) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $370.00 Each NO BID

5 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#54 L) (Louvered) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $370.00 Each NO BID

6 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#54 R) (Louvered) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $370.00 Each NO BID

7 LED 3 Section Traffic Signal Head (#25) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $295.00 Each NO BID

8 LED 5 Section Traffic Signal Head (#64R) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $495.00 Each NO BID

9 LED 5 Section Traffic Signal Head (#64L) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $495.00 Each NO BID

10 LED 1 Section Traffic Signal Head (#37) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $99.00 Each NO BID

11 LED 4 Section Traffic Signal Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $395.00 Each NO BID

12 LED ICC Pedestrian Head (#33) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $345.00 Each NO BID

13 Audible LED ICC Pedestrian Head (#33) 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

14 Polycarbonate Backplate for 3-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $72.00 Each NO BID

15 Polycarbonate Backplate for 5-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $149.00 Each NO BID

16 Aluminum Universal Louvered Backplate for 3-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $75.00 Each NO BID

17 Aluminum Universal Louvered Backplate for 5-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $135.00 Each NO BID

18 Retroreflective Backplate for 3-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $109.00 Each NO BID

19 Retroreflective Backplate for 5-Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $174.00 Each NO BID

20 Astro Bracket (Cable Type Mast Arm Clamp), AS-3009-62-SS 1 or More Each NO BID Each $92.00 Each $75.70

21 Astro Bracket (Cable Type Mast Arm Clamp), AS-3009-84-SS 1 or More Each NO BID Each $95.00 Each $77.20

22 Astro Bracket Shoe and Tube Assembly 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

23 Astro Bracket Vertical Tube Mounted Sign Bracket 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

24 12" Tunnel Visor 1 or More Each NO BID Each $19.95 Each $18.00

25 120V, Green Ball LED 1 or More Each $25.00 Each $40.00 Each $38.00

26 120V, Yellow Ball LED 1 or More Each $25.00 Each $40.00 Each $39.00

27 120V, Red Ball LED 1 or More Each $25.00 Each $40.00 Each $38.00

28 120V, Green Arrow LED 1 or More Each $35.00 Each $40.00 Each $48.15

29 120V, Yellow Arrow LED 1 or More Each $35.00 Each $40.00 Each $42.00

30 12V, Yellow Ball LED 1 or More Each $54.00 Each NO BID Each $58.00

31 Eagle SA Poly 3 Section Head 1 or More Each NO BID Each $150.00 Each NO BID

32 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 36", Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each $31.50 Each $19.70

33 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 36". Natural 1 or More Each NO BID Each $24.00 Each $19.70

34 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 36". Brown 1 or More Each NO BID Each $31.50 Each $19.70

35 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 46". Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each $35.50 Each $26.70

36 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 46". Natural 1 or More Each NO BID Each $28.00 Each $26.70

37 1 1/2" Pole Top Support Tube 46". Brown 1 or More Each NO BID Each $35.50 Each $26.70

38 Astro Brac Gusseted Tube, 3/4" opening, pvc insert,1 1/2", threaded one 
end, Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

39 Astro Brac Gusseted Tube, 3/4" opening, pvc insert,1 1/2", threaded one 
end, Natural 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

40 Astro Brac Gusseted Tube, 3/4" opening, pvc insert,1 1/2", threaded one 
end, Brown 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

41 Astro Brac 5 Section Cluster Arm Kit, Zinc Washer 1 or More Each NO BID Each $155.50 Each $133.40

42 Astro Brac Two Way Arm Kit, Zinc Washer 1 or More Each NO BID Each $153.50 Each $130.15

Traffic Signals, Inc

 You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing 
collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Quantities Listed are for evaluation purposes only.  There is no guaranteed quantity of purchases under this contract.

MoboTrex, Inc. Gades Sales Company Inc.

mailto:dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org


43 Astro Brac One Way Arm Kit 8 1/2" CTC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $38.50 Each $31.50

44 Helping Hand Installation Tool 1 or More Each NO BID Each $62.75 Each $46.20

45 Confirmation Light Assembly with Globe 1 or More Each NO BID Each $85.50 Each $83.80

46 Octagon Base,PB-5349, Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each $199.75 Each $170.70

47 Octagon Base,PB-5349, PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $181.75 Each $154.80

48 Octagon Base, PB-5349, Brown 1 or More Each NO BID Each $199.75 Each $164.70

49 Pole Cap Dome, Aluminum, 4 1/2" OD., Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each $22.75 Each $18.70

50 Pole Cap Dome, Aluminum, 4 1/2" OD., Natural 1 or More Each NO BID Each $15.50 Each $16.70

51 Pole Cap Assy, Dome Type, for 4-1/2 OD, Alum 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each $18.70

52 Sign Clamp, U bolt, 4" (4-1/2" OD) Pipe, Set of 2, Aluminum 1 or More Each NO BID Each $23.50 Each $23.70

53 Post Top Assy., 1-way Terminal Compartment, 3 Section, Aluminum, 
Painted Bronze 1 or More Each NO BID Each $204.50 Each $152.40

54 Post Top Assy., 1-way Terminal Compartment, 3 Section, Aluminum, 
Natural 1 or More Each NO BID Each $183.25 Each $152.40

55 Geometrically Programmed Louver 12" 1 or More Each NO BID Each $192.00 Each $127.30

56 120V, 200W Metal Halide Cobra Luminaire with Lamp 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

57 120V, 200W Equivalent Mogul Based LED 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

58 Standard Cover Lower, Pelco Equiv. AP-1087 1 or More Each NO BID Each $48.00 Each $43.60

59 Standard Cover Upper, Pelco Equiv. PB-5356 1 or More Each NO BID Each $19.00 Each $22.40

60 4" x 10' schedule 40 Aluminum Pole, 8 NPT Pelco Equiv. PB-5100-10-
P33, Black 1 or More Each NO BID Each $241.00 Each $192.70

61 4" x 10' schedule 40 Aluminum Pole, 8 NPT Pelco Equiv. PB-5100-10-
P39, Brown 1 or More Each NO BID Each $241.00 Each $192.70

62 4" x 10' schedule 40 Aluminum Pole, 8 NPT Pelco Equiv.PB-5100-10-
PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $205.00 Each $161.70

63 4" x 10' Schedule 40 Aluminum Pole, 8 NPT Pelco Equiv. PB-5100-10-
Brushed 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each $161.70

64 PB-5100-13-PNC, 4 x 13 Aluminum Pole 1 or More Each NO BID Each $275.00 Each $217.25

65 PB-5100-13-P33, 4 x 13 Aluminum Pole 1 or More Each NO BID Each $320.00 Each $249.75

66 PB-5100-13-P39, 4 x 13 Aluminum Pole 1 or More Each NO BID Each $320.00 Each $249.75

67 PB-5325-PNC, Base and Collar Assembly for Square Base 1 or More Each NO BID Each $66.50 Each $61.50

68 PB-5334-PNC, Aluminum square base assembly 1 or More Each NO BID Each $149.00 Each $121.40

69 #22 AS-0125-3-62-PNC, Sign Tube 1 or More Each NO BID Each $157.00 Each $123.40

70 #22 AS-0125-3-84-PNC, Sign Tube 1 or More Each NO BID Each $162.00 Each $129.80

71 #22 AS-0125-4-62-PNC, Sign Tube 1 or More Each NO BID Each $164.00 Each $131.60

72 #22 AS-0125-4-84-PNC, Sign Tube 1 or More Each NO BID Each $171.00 Each $135.60

73 #23 AB-0507-18-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $25.00 Each $26.80

74 #23 AB-0507-24-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $29.00 Each $31.20

75 #39 AB-2003-23-PNC, Gusseted Tube with Vinyl Insert 1 or More Each NO BID Each $21.00 Each $25.30

76 #39 AB-2003-37-PNC, Gusseted Tube with Vinyl Insert 1 or More Each NO BID Each $27.00 Each $27.85

77 #39 AB-2003-46-PNC, Gusseted Tube with Vinyl Insert 1 or More Each NO BID Each $32.00 Each $33.00

78 #39 AB-2003-58-PNC, Gusseted Tube with Vinyl Insert 1 or More Each NO BID Each $40.00 Each $38.60

79 #39 AB-2003-74-PNC, Gusseted Tube with Vinyl Insert 1 or More Each NO BID Each $48.00 Each $44.15

80 #39 Paint Adder (added to PNC price per tube) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $7.50 Each NO BID

81 #1 - 11 No Bracket or Backplate Included (Head with LED's only) 1 or More Each NO BID Each NO BID Each NO BID

82 #14 BK-1003 ABS Plastic (no tape or louvers) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $64.00 Each NO BID

83 #15 BK-1007 ABS Plastic (no tape or louvers) 1 or More Each NO BID Each $138.00 Each NO BID

84 #32 - 37 SE-0326-L (36" or 46") 1 or More Each NO BID Each $29.00 Each $30.85

85 #41 AB-5005-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $160.00 Each $122.40

86 #42 AB-5008-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $158.00 Each $121.50

87 #43 AB-4005-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $34.00 Each $32.50

88 #45 SM-0284-CL-PNC (no mount) Clear globe 1 or More Each NO BID Each $88.00 Each $73.20

89 #53 SE-3013-3-P39, 1 or More Each NO BID Each $210.00 Each $147.40

90 #54 SE-3013-3-PNC 1 or More Each NO BID Each $188.00 Each $147.40

91 #55 GL-1010 with Visor, Louvered Visor 1 or More Each NO BID Each $197.00 Each $151.70

30 - 60 Days ARO

$11,328.45TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                                                                   
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $5,247.10

4 - 6 Weeks ARODELIVERY:

$199.00

NOTES: *THEIR TOTAL $6,723.15 OUR TOTAL $5,247.10 
DIFFERENCE OF $1,476.05

45 Days ARO
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