Y Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy.
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor

Tulsa, OK 74103

IFB 20-812
BATWING MOWERS
WATER & SEWER DEPARMENT

Senior Buyer: Ashleigh McCarn
amccarn@cityoftulsa.org
Please contact if you have any questions

1. Delivery:

BID DATE: January 23, 2020

If your Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order,
pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)
Kubota of Northwest ) . . .
Jensen Tractor Ranch Inc Maverick Machinery LLC - 1 Maverick Machinery LLC - 2
Arkansas, Inc.
.. Estimated ) Extended MFR & ) Extended MFR & ) Extended | MFR & Part ) Extended
Item Description ) Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost MFR & Part #
Annual Quanity Cost Part # Cost Part # Cost # Cost
1 15-Foot Batwing Mower (shaft driven) 1 or More $16,648.94 | $16,648.94 4150 $14,991.08 | $14,991.08 | Land Pride | $22,321.40 | $22,321.40 | °oos’C | $16,910.60 | $16,910.60 | *“hoo ol
Options
1. Complete set of heavy-duty cutting blades & bolts 1 or More $550.00 $550.00 Set $325.00 $325.00 | LandPride | $387.76 $387.76  |*" i e | $387.76 $387.76 | *" o sorare
2 15-Foot Batwing Mower (Hydraulically Driven) 1 or More $38,500.00 | $38,500.00 | Falcon15 | $38,456.10 | $38,456.10 | Falcon hysraioal oren | $0-00 $0.00 | L e ortven
Options
1. Complete set of heavy-duty cutting blades & bolts 1 or More $610.00 | $610.00 | sSet4x5 | $490.00 | $490.00 Falcon hysraioal oren | $0-00 $0.00 | L e oriven
2. Full set of extra hoses 1 or More $3,750.00 | $3,750.00 | Individual | $365.10 | $365.10 Gates hydraioal oren | $0-00 $0.00 | e oriven
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: *
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $601058'94 $541627'28 $221709'16 $171298'36
DELIVERY: 30 days on 4150 and 180 days on Hyd If not in stock - 30 Days 0 - 90 Days 0 - 90 Days
) *Total cost reflects corrected price based
Notes: . .
on bid pricing
) Construction Sales & Services Newton Equipment LLC dba
The Hall Group, Inc. P&K Equipment (John Deere) ’ d p ]
Inc. Stewart Martin Equipment
.. Estimated ) Extended MFR & ) Extended MFR & ) Extended | MFR & Part ) Extended
Item Description ) Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost MFR & Part #
Annual Quanity Cost Part # Cost Part # Cost # Cost
1 15-Foot Batwing Mower (shaft driven) 1 or More $12,914.00 | $12,914.00 ST-180 $20,342.40 | $20,342.40 |iohn Deere R10| $18,540.00 | $18,540.00 | BH2815R4 | $16,800.00 | $16,800.00 RC4715
Options
1. Complete set of heavy-duty cutting blades & bolts 1 or More $0.00 s0.00 [N s15000 | $150.00 $41000 | sat0.00 [P IERS] g36150 | s3grse | PATEC4E2
2 15-Foot Batwing Mower (Hydraulically Driven) 1 or More No Bid No Bid NA NA NA
Options
1. Complete set of heavy-duty cutting blades & bolts 1 or More No Bid No Bid NA NA
2. Full set of extra hoses 1 or More No Bid No Bid NA NA
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $121914'00 $201492'40 $181950'00 $171161'50
DELIVERY: 60 - 90 Days ARO 45 Days 30 Days
Notes:
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