
TAC 1177A Senior Buyer: Ashleigh McCarn
High Pressure Sewer Cleaner and Vacuum amccarn@cityoftulsa.org

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Bid Date: May 21, 2020
Tulsa, OK 741023

2. Pricing

Item Description Estimated Annual Qty Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1 High Pressure Sewer Cleaner and Vacuum 7 or more $383,225.36 $2,682,577.52 $441,173.00 $3,088,211.00 $421,661.51 $2,951,630.57 $427,790.00 $2,994,530.00 $428,128.00 $2,996,896.00

1 Automatic rear differential lock for rearaxles. 1 or more NA NA $0.00 $0.00 Included in base 
spec $0.00 Included $0.00

2a Pipe Wolf Nozzle. 4 or more $1,560.34 $6,241.36 $1,560.34 $6,241.36 $1,560.34 $6,241.36 $1,560.34 $6,241.36

2b 3-inch General Purpose Nozzle 6 or more $735.26 $4,411.56 $735.26 $4,411.56 $735.26 $4,411.56 $735.26 $4,411.56

2c Chisel Nozzle 4 or more $442.32 $1,769.28 $442.32 $1,769.28 $442.32 $1,769.28 $442.32 $1,769.28

2d Wart Hog WGR Magnum Nozzle. 6 or more $2,344.66 $14,067.96 $2,344.66 $14,067.96 $2,344.66 $14,067.96 $2,344.66 $14,067.96

2e Agitator Nozzle 4 or more $437.20 *$1,748.80 $437.20 *$1,748.80 $437.20 $1,748.80 $437.20 $1,748.80

3a Hose Repari Tool, Manual swedging tool 1 or more $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00 $2,983.00

3b Swedge type hose end fittings 50 or more $13.65 $682.50 $13.65 $682.50 $13.65 $682.50 $13.65 $682.50

3c Swivel Hose connectors. 25 or more $9.25 $231.25 $9.25 $231.25 $9.25 $231.25 $9.25 $231.25

4 $5,105.00 $5,105.00 $5,105.00 $5,105.00

4a
Engine, include Engine Electronics, Turbo, and 
injectors, etc. 1 or more $2,484.00 $2,484.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00 $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $800.00 $800.00

4b Exhaust Aftertratment and DPF. 1 or more $700.00 $700.00 Included $0.00 Included in 4A $0.00 $650.00 $650.00

4c Transmission. 1 or more $826.00 $826.00 $818.00 $818.00 $818.00 $818.00 $818.00 $818.00

4d Chassis Electronics including wiring harness. 1 or more $3,230.00 $3,230.00 $710.00 $710.00 $703.00 $703.00 $703.00 $703.00

5

5a Three (3) year Extended Warranty 1 or more $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66 $6,477.66

5b Five (5) year Extended Warranty 1 or more $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33 $13,472.33

6

6a Three (3) year Agreement 1 or more $41,698.00 $41,698.00 $50,311.00 $50,311.00 $53,543.00 $53,543.00 $53,184.00 $53,184.00

6b Five (5) year Agreement 1 or more $73,749.00 $73,749.00 $84,198.00 $84,198.00 $95,185.00 $95,185.00 $98,770.00 $98,770.00

6c Ten (10) year Agreement 1 or more $23,973.00 $23,973.00 No Bid $0.00 $67,059.00 *$67,059.00 $72,980.00 *$72,980.00

7 360 Degree exterior camera system 1 or more $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00

8 Master Cutoff Switch 1 or more Included $0.00 $174.00 $174.00 Included $0.00 Included $0.00

9 Frame Mounted Jump Start Studs 1 or more Included $0.00 $135.00 $135.00 Included $0.00 Included $0.00

Notes: * Total cost corrected based on unit cost                                                                            
**Item 6C No Bid Vactor *Total cost corrected based on unit cost * Item 6C Vactor No Bid

Premier Truck Group - Bid 2

$3,213,761.70

Chassis Delivery is 90-120 days after 
receipt of PO                                            
Vactor is 150 to 180 days after factory of 
receipt of chassis

* Item 6C Vactor No Bid

Summit Truck Group of 
Oklahoma LLC dba Roberts 
Truck Center of Oklahoma

*$3,145,913.47

Vactor 150 - 180 days after receipt of 
chassis                                                             
Chassis 60 - 90 days ARO

Premier Truck Group - Bid 1

$3,209,619.70

Chassis Delivery is 90-120 days after 
receipt of PO                                            
Vactor is 150 to 180 days after factory of 
receipt of chassis

*$3,291,706.70

Rush Truck Center, Tulsa

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                      
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

1. Delivery: 

Improved Construction 
Methods

$2,682,577.52

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the 
Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

If you Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

Options

Extended Warranty for 5 years or 150,000 miles.

Extended Warranty on entire High-Pressure Cleaner Module.

Preventative Maintenance Agreement on the Complete Truck

Annual Price Adjustment:

Delivery: 240 Days 210 - 240 Days
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