
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 660J Senior Buyer: Ashleigh McCarn

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Cold Lay Asphalt amccarn@cityoftulsa.org

Tulsa, OK 74103 Streets & Stormwater Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: June 11, 2020

1. Delivery:

2. Pricing

ITEM DESCRIPTION Estimated Annual 
Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1 Cold Lay Asphalt (Bulk) 1350 tons $90.00 $121,500.00 $89.00 *$120,150.00 No Bid No Bid $115.00 $155,250.00 No Bid No Bid

2 Cold Lay Asphalt (Bags) - see technical spec. 
for bag size 90,000 pounds No Bid No Bid $0.23 $20,700.00 0.675 $60,750.00 No Bid No Bid $0.17 $15,300.00

T & C Asphalt 
Materials, LLC

1 - 2 Days

You must be able to deliver the Goods and /or Services as specified in your Bid.  Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing 
collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

$121,500.00 *$140,850.00 $60,750.00 $155,250.00 $15,300.00

Tulsa Asphalt LLC

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

TOTAL EXTENDED COST                                                                                      
(All costs must be included or your bid will be disqualified)

Dunham's Ashalt 
Services, Inc.

Notes: F.O.B. Plant

If your bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and /or to begin providing services:

0 Days - In Stock 1 Day - Bulk                                         
3 Days - Bags

Delivery:

*Extended Cost Corrected 
Based on Unit Cost

Annual Price Adjustment:

TBI Solutions LLC Asphalt Producers Inc.

5 - 10 Business Days 1 up to 5 Days

Fixed 2% CPI-U
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