A New Kind of Energy

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 145E

175 E 2nd Street 15th Floor Sand

Tulsa, OK 74103 Streets & Stormwater Department
Bid Opening: July 2, 2020

Senior Buyer: Ashleigh McCarn
amccarn@cityoftulsa.org
Please contact if you have any questions

1. Delivery:

If your bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and /or to begin providing services:

You must be able to deliver the Goods and /or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the
Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Anchor Stone Company

A. Material only (delivery not included)

ltem Description Cost per ton
Al Concrete Sand $7.00
Fill Sand (Screened & washed — no
A2 blow sand acceptable) $7.00
A3 #6 Mason Sand No Bid
A4 #6 Dry Sand (Sandblasting sand) No Bid
A5 #20 Dry sand (Sandblasting sand) No Bid
A6 #8 Mason Sand No Bid
A7 Manufactured Fill Sand $7.00
A8 Double Wash Mason Sand No Bid
B. Delivered material
Delivered cost of concrete sand (Al) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
Al Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson $7.00 $5.70 $12.70 $5.00 $12.00
B2 1710 W Charles Page Blvd $7.00 $6.00 $13.00 $5.40 $12.40
B3 5701 E 36 St N $7.00 $6.50 $13.50 $5.90 $12.90
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd $7.00 $6.60 $13.60 $6.00 $13.00
B5 6600 S Union $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $3.95 $10.95
B6 5675 S Garnett Road $7.00 $4.60 $11.60 $4.00 $11.00
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. $7.00 $6.60 $13.60 $6.10 $13.10
B8 450 W 23 St $7.00 $5.70 $12.70 $5.00 $12.00
B9 6612 E 61 ST $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $4.00 $11.00
B10 5605 S Garnett $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $4.00 $11.00
B11 4502 S Galveston $7.00 $5.00 $12.00 $4.40 $11.40
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave $7.00 $7.40 $14.40 $6.70 $13.70
Delivered cost of fill sand (A2) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A2 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson $7.00 $5.70 $12.70 $5.00 $12.00
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd $7.00 $6.00 $13.00 $5.40 $12.40
B3 5701 E 36 St N $7.00 $6.50 $13.50 $5.90 $12.90



mailto:amccarn@cityoftulsa.org

B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd $7.00 $6.60 $13.60 $6.00 $13.00
B5 6600 S Union $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $3.95 $10.95
B6 5675 S Garnett Road $7.00 $4.60 $11.60 $4.00 $11.00
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. $7.00 $6.60 $13.60 $6.10 $13.10
B8 450 W 23 St $7.00 $5.70 $12.70 $5.00 $12.00
B9 6612 E 61 ST $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $4.00 $11.00
B10 5605 S Garnett $7.00 $4.50 $11.50 $4.00 $11.00
B11 4502 S Galveston $7.00 $5.00 $12.00 $4.40 $11.40
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave $7.00 $7.40 $14.40 $6.70 $13.70

Delivered cost of #6 Mason sand (A3)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location A3 Cost/Ton Delivered Cost/Ton Total Delivered Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid

Delivered cost of #6 Dry sand (A4)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Item Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A4 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Blvd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid

Delivered cost of #20 Dry sand (A5)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A5 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid




Delivered cost of #8 Mason sand (A6) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A6 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid
Delivered cost of Manufactured Fill Sand (A7) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Item Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A7 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson $7.00 $6.00 $13.00 $5.40 $12.40
B2 1710 W Charles Page Blivd $7.00 $5.80 $12.80 $5.20 $12.20
B3 5701 E 36 St N $7.00 $4.20 $11.20 $3.50 $10.50
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd $7.00 $4.20 $11.20 $3.50 $10.50
B5 6600 S Union $7.00 $6.30 $13.30 $5.70 $12.70
B6 5675 S Garnett Road $7.00 $5.20 $12.20 $4.50 $11.50
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. $7.00 $4.40 $11.40 $3.80 $10.80
BS 450 W 23 St $7.00 $6.00 $13.00 $5.40 $12.40
B9 6612 E 61 ST $7.00 $5.30 $12.30 $4.70 $11.70
B10 5605 S Garnett $7.00 $5.20 $12.20 $4.50 $11.50
B11 4502 S Galveston $7.00 $6.00 $13.00 $5.40 $12.40
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave $7.00 $4.20 $11.20 $3.50 $10.50
Delivered cost of Double Wash Mason (A8) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A8 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 7301 S Riverside No Bid
B2 3607 S 139 East Ave No Bid
B3 7714 E 71 Street No Bid
B4 3443 S Mingo Road No Bid
Bob-Tails: $3.10 for first mile and $0.28/ton for each additional Mile - Rate per ton per loaded
Cost per mile to locations not listed mile
above: Tractor-Trailers: $2.95 for the first mile and $0.25/ton for each additonal mile - Rate per ton
per loaded mile
Delivery: As Needed by The City of Tulsa




Mohawk Materials Co, Inc.

A. Material only (delivery not included)

ltem Description Cost per ton
Al Concrete Sand No Bid
AD Fill Sand (Screened & washed — no No Bid
blow sand acceptable)
A3 #6 Mason Sand No Bid
A4 #6 Dry Sand (Sandblasting sand) $30.00
A5 #20 Dry sand (Sandblasting sand) $30.00
A6 #8 Mason Sand No Bid
A7 Manufactured Fill Sand No Bid
A8 Double Wash Mason Sand No Bid

B. Delivered material

Delivered cost of concrete sand (Al)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Item Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
Al Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid

Delivered cost of fill sand (A2)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A2 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid

Delivered cost of #6 Mason sand (A3)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A3 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid




B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid

Delivered cost of #6 Dry sand (A4)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A4 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B3 5701 E 36 St N $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B5 6600 S Union $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B6 5675 S Garnett Road $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B8 450 W 23 St $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B9 6612 E 61 ST $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B10 5605 S Garnett $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B11 4502 S Galveston $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00

Delivered cost of #20 Dry sand (A5)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Item Delivery Location Delivered Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A5 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B3 5701 E 36 St N $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B5 6600 S Union $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B6 5675 S Garnett Road $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B7 4122 E Mohawk Blvd. $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B8 450 W 23 St $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B9 6612 E 61 ST $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B10 5605 S Garnett $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B11 4502 S Galveston $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $8.00 $38.00

Delivered cost of #8 Mason sand (A6)

Bob Tail Delivery

Trailer Delivery

Material Cost/Ton , Total .
Item Delivery Location Hauling charge Delivered Hauling charge Total Delivered Cost/Ton
A6 Cost/Ton Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid




Delivered cost of Manufactured Fill Sand (A7) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location A7 Cost/Ton Delivered Cost/Ton Total Delivered Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton
B1 23rd & Jackson No Bid
B2 1710 W Charles Page Bivd No Bid
B3 5701 E 36 St N No Bid
B4 7301 Mohawk Blvd No Bid
B5 6600 S Union No Bid
B6 5675 S Garnett Road No Bid
B7 4122 E Mohawk Bivd. No Bid
B8 450 W 23 St No Bid
B9 6612 E 61 ST No Bid
B10 5605 S Garnett No Bid
B11 4502 S Galveston No Bid
B12 2601 N 193 E Ave No Bid
Delivered cost of Double Wash Mason (A8) Bob Tail Delivery Trailer Delivery
. . Material Cost/Ton Hauling charge T.otal Hauling charge .
Iltem Delivery Location A8 Cost/Ton Delivered Cost/Ton Total Delivered Cost/Ton
Cost/Ton

B1 7301 S Riverside No Bid
B2 3607 S 139 East Ave No Bid
B3 7714 E 71 Street No Bid
B4 3443 S Mingo Road No Bid

Cost per mile to locations not listed

N/A
above:

Delivery: 1
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