Tulsa

A Mew Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor
Tulsa, OK 74103

1. Delivery:

TAC 1032B

Playground Safety Surfacing
Park & Recreation Department

Buyer: Donny Tiemann

Bid Date: January 21, 2021

If your bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and /or to begin providing services:

dtiemann@cityotulsa.org
Please contact if you have any questions

You must be able to deliver the Goods and /or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing
collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)
. ' Elm Creek Gravel, LLC dba Eco | Bliss Products and Services
Chip N Saw, LLC The Fibar Group, LLC T ’
Wood Solutions Inc.
Estimate Annual Unit Cost Manufacturer & Unit Cost Manufacturer & Unit Cost Manufacturer & Unit Cost Manufacturer &
ITEM DESCRIPTION E E E E
SC o Quantity (per Truck Load) xtended Cost Part Number (per Truck Load) xtended Cost Part Number (per Truck Load) xtended Cost Part Number (per Truck Load) xtended Cost Part Number
Engineered Wood Fiber Playground Safety Surfacing - $2,006.10 (90 E:_r(n:(;;)eaeléc(iravel
1 Truck load shall consist of approximately 100 cubic 13 Truck Loads $23,400.00 $22.29 per/TL L Y| Fibar - EWF 000 $2,168.00 $28,184.00 N . $1,763.52 $22,925.76
ards per truckload) Wood Solutions:
Y . Plavzone
1a  |Option: Installation and Spreading of material noted 1 Truck Load $400.00 No Bid No Bid NIA $1,000.00 *$1000.00 No Bid No Bid
in item 1 (100 cubic yard truck load).
Engineered Wood Fiber Playground Safety Surfacing - E:_r(n:(;;)eaeléc(iravel
2 Truck load shall consist of approximately 50 cubic 6 Truck Loads $5,400.00 No Bid No Bid N/A $1,084.00 $6,504.00 Wood Solutions: $1,128.52 $6,771.12
yards. :
Plavzone
24 |Option: Installation and Spreading of material noted 1 Truck Load $200.00 No Bid No Bid NIA $500.00 #$500.00 No Bid No Bid
in item 2 (50 cubic yard truck load).
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: $26,07930

(All costs must be included or your bid will be disqualified)

(13 truckloads - 90 cy each)

*$36,188.00

$29,696.88

Delivery:

2 days

5- 10 Business Days

72 hours - 3 days

Annual Price Adjustment:

Fixed 20% (may be less)

Notes:

Vendor did not enter extended or total cost

*Extended cost corrected based on unit cost
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