' Tulsa

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 119D Senior Buyer: Donny Tiemann
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Automotive Parts & Supplies - EMD dtiemann@citvoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Asset Management Department Please contact if you have any questions

Date: October 21, 2021

1. Delivery

‘You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City Terminating your agreement or canceling the Purchase Order Pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to
which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

The City of Tulsa does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases that will be made during the agreement period. If the Seller's prices cannot stay competitive with the outside market, the City reserves the right to purchase from outside sources or low
bidder(s).

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Quantities listed are for evaluation purposes only. There is no guaranteed quantity of purchases under this agreement

NAPA Auto IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Advance Stores Company, Inc.
item | Part Number Description of Parts Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1 7480 MEDIUM SANDING DISC 250 $1.14 $285.00 $1.30 $325.00 $1.29 $322.50
2 17 [ Aerosol Carburetor Cleaner 1194 $3.59 $4,286.46 $3.00 $3,582.00 $4.86 $5,802.84
3 10202R 2 % “ Red Clearance Light 124 $1.61 $199.64 $2.24 $277.76 $3.64 $451.36
4 11886 WASHER SOLVENT - GALLON 520 $18.31 $9,521.20 $3.20 $1,664.00 $3.21 $1,669.20
5 1114534 12V Continuous Relay 14 $24.45 $342.30 $33.68 $471.52 $44.27 $619.78
6 12225 AR PLUG,MALE 65 $1.09 $70.85 $1.13 $73.45 $3.59 $233.35
7 22058 DIELECTRIC GREASE 45 $4.18 $188.10 $6.24 $280.80 $7.07 $318.15
8 24X30P 24"X30" MUDFLAP 60 $11.10 $666.00 $11.07 $664.20 $9.96 $597.60
9 158 Bulb 17 $0.65 $76.05 $0.43 $50.31 $4.19 $490.23
10 |1ePB | Aerosol Penetrant 48 $5.15 $247.20 $6.29 $301.92 $5.32 $255.36
1 194 Light Bulb 340 $0.30 $102.00 $0.26 $88.40 $0.33 $112.20
12 22013 Single Edge Blades 300 $6.65 $1,995.00 $0.06 $18.00 $0.07 $21.00
13 |262D Flasher 48 $20.85 $1,000.80 $10.90 $523.20 $15.71 $754.08
14 [30-414-10 453X1 4" Tire Stem 70 $1.15 $80.50 $0.61 $42.70 $1.34 $93.80
15 |30-463 Tire Valve 50 $1.84 $92.00 $2.46 $123.00 $5.39 $269.50
16 [31-16 Wiper Blade 178 $4.10 $729.80 $3.19 $567.82 $8.70 $1,548.60
17 3120 Wiper Blade 635 $4.25 $2,698.75 $3.19 $2,025.65 $8.70 $5,524.50
18 3122 Wiper Blade 835 $2.35 $1,962.25 $3.19 $2,663.65 $10.04 $8,383.40
19 |32201-10 Tire Valve 55 $2.80 $154.00 $4.00 $220.00 $7.19 $395.45
20 |32-204 Truck Tire Valve 70 $3.20 $224.00 $4.82 $337.40 $7.19 $503.30
21 325V Spot Light 10 $92.58 $925.80 $132.71 $1,327.10 No Bid
22 |35489 Thermostat Gasket 26 $2.61 $67.86 $6.18 $160.68 $7.55 $196.30
23 |a7.5H1 Aerostick Bulb 10 $4.19 $41.90 $6.71 $67.10 $12.11 $121.10
24 |aa13 SEALED BEAM LAMP 65 $7.97 $518.05 $8.39 $545.35 $14.53 $944.45
25  [40202R Tail Light % $4.83 $463.68 $5.95 $571.20 $6.79 $651.84
26 |40203 4" Sealed Dome Lamp 65 $7.48 $486.20 $9.03 $586.95 $11.89 $772.85
27 |41569-15 15" RUBBER STRAP 35 $0.99 $34.65 $2.63 $92.05 $1.26 $44.10
28 |a1a8 Oil Seal 40 $4.08 $163.20 $6.70 $268.00 $6.39 $255.60
29 |a160 Front Wheel Seal 55 $6.80 $374.00 $11.25 $618.75 $7.99 $439.45
30 faan1 Sealed Beam Bulb 29 $5.33 $154.57 $7.02 $203.58 $7.69 $223.01
31 4413 Sealed Beam Lamp 63 $7.97 $502.11 $8.39 $528.57 $14.53 $915.39
32 [ryt16 Relay, Electrical 27 $10.62 $286.74 $6.36 $171.72 $22.13 $597.51
33 |s00-1088 Ball Joint 53 $10.50 $556.50 $57.10 $3,026.30 $33.19 $1,759.07
34 |ko70975 ine Belt 12 $8.75 $105.00 $29.39 $352.68 $26.12 $313.44
35  |K080470HD  |Serpentine Belt 28 $17.65 $494.20 $22.25 $623.00 $16.74 $468.72
36 |5202 #2 Hose Clamp 60 $1.30 $78.00 $0.41 $24.60 $0.64 $38.40
37 |s208 #6 Hose Clamp 60 $0.89 $53.40 $0.51 $30.60 $0.83 $49.80
38 |s212 #12 Hose Clamp 70 $1.17 $81.90 $0.51 $35.70 $0.83 $58.10
39 |s316Y101 Light 50 $28.36 $1,418.00 $34.59 $1,729.50 $45.04 $2,252.00
40 |s4385 HIGH TEMP GREASE CARTRIDGE 450 $3.58 $1,611.00 $3.19 $1,435.50 $6.24 $2,808.00
M 56000PM BACK-UP ALARM 35 $18.40 $644.00 $25.04 $876.40 $27.59 $965.65
42 |s707 Bearing 20 $5.65 $113.00 $14.69 $293.80 $16.11 $322.20
43 [e0202R RED OBLONG LAMP 84 $5.03 $422.52 $7.77 $652.68 $5.94 $498.96
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NAPA Auto IEH Auto Parts LLC dba Auto Plus Auto Parts Advance Stores Company, Inc.

Item Part Number Description of Parts Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
44 611-259 WHEEL LUG NUT 120 $3.10 $372.00 $4.26 $511.20 $4.07 $488.40
45 65266 OIL DRAIN PLUG 40 $2.06 $82.40 $2.54 $101.60 $4.34 $173.60
46 620-108 Cooling Fan 25 $79.58 $1,989.50 $88.19 $2,204.75 $97.74 $2,443.50
47 645WK Snow Plow 24 $168.21 $4,037.04 $193.61 $4,646.64 $130.04 $3,120.96
48 66-1250 C.V. SHAFT 6 $50.88 $305.28 $76.42 $458.52 $76.53 $459.18
49 815-2 AA BATTERY 96 $0.46 $44.16 $2.32 $222.72 $6.43 $617.28
50 70-900 120Z. POWER STEERING FLUID 156 $2.13 $332.28 $1.52 $237.12 $4.13 $644.28
51 PM75RSHD  |75W Rough Service Bulb 152 $2.44 $370.88 $3.08 $468.16 $1.83 $278.16
52 795 Bulb 44 $3.90 $171.60 $5.93 $260.92 $11.71 $515.24
53 70-953 QUART POWER STEERING FLUID 28 $3.92 $109.76 $3.00 $84.00 $5.05 $141.40
54 8370W Strobe Bulb 63 $40.83 $2,572.29 $52.91 $3,333.33 No Bid

55 8660S Axle Seal 25 $1.85 $46.25 $3.08 $77.00 $6.39 $159.75
56 84706 5/8" HEATER VALVE 25 $6.38 $159.50 $9.24 $231.00 $9.34 $233.50
57 89007 Belt Idler Pulley 17 $12.99 $220.83 $16.54 $281.18 $17.70 $300.90
58 9-1660 Assorted Body Filler Spreaders 22 $0.85 $18.70 $1.45 $31.90 $5.19 $114.18
59 Sep-69 Large Truck Floor Mats 21 $48.98 $1,028.58 $15.41 $323.61 $36.79 $772.59
60 91508 Wheel Seal 35 $6.20 $217.00 $9.81 $343.35 $11.83 $414.05
61 92551Y Amber Strobe Light 143 $65.99 $9,436.57 $96.59 $13,812.37 $60.34 $8,628.62
62 94014-0002 Spotlight w/black housing 15 $152.72 $2,290.80 $162.95 $2,444.25 No Bid

63 94926 Light Pigtail 58 $1.57 $91.06 $1.71 $99.18 $2.11 $122.38
64 960Y100 IHC Turn Signal Switch 10 $78.86 $788.60 $98.97 $989.70 $85.95 $859.50
65 97804 8 %2 Convex Mirror 49 $12.51 $612.99 $11.78 $577.22 $13.16 $644.84
66 9930 30" Strobe Harness 19 $28.33 $538.27 $73.37 $1,394.03 No Bid

67 A9-00K Battery Cable 18 $22.23 $400.14 $21.87 $393.66 $27.59 $496.62
68 SP493 Spark Plug 421 $2.31 $972.51 $2.59 $1,090.39 $3.41 $1,435.61
69 SP479 Spark Plug 120 $2.08 $249.60 $2.59 $310.80 $3.41 $409.20
70 ATC30 30 AMP Fuse 200 $0.25 $50.00 $0.52 $104.00 $3.68 $736.00
il WP9038 Water Pump 12 $18.82 $225.84 $33.92 $407.04 $40.79 $489.48
72 BP1255/H1 Bulb 98 $3.90 $382.20 $3.91 $383.18 $7.19 $704.62
73 BP60 Electrical Test Clip 60 $0.30 $18.00 $0.30 $18.00 $0.48 $28.80
74 EB1 Aerosol Degreaser 150 $3.64 $546.00 $3.38 $507.00 $4.59 $688.50
75 CT11B 11" Cable Tie 2600 $6.72 $17,472.00 $0.13 $338.00 $4.89 $12,714.00
76 CT14HDB 14" H.D. Black Cable Tie 1000 $5.83 $5,830.00 $0.18 $180.00 $1.67 $1,670.00
7 CX1917 Idle Air Control Valve 44 $50.03 $2,201.32 $46.00 $2,024.00 $124.79 $5,490.76
78 DBL2 Disc Brake Lube 21 $13.06 $274.26 $13.81 $290.01 $11.49 $241.29
79 DS126 Toggle Switch 44 $4.57 $201.08 $2.92 $128.48 $3.93 $172.92
80 ES20798 Adjusting Sleeve 22 $9.21 $202.62 $20.99 $461.78 $22.93 $504.46
81 ES3494 Tie Rod End 33 $9.50 $313.50 $31.52 $1,040.16 $35.88 $1,184.04
82 ES3495 Outer Tie Rod End 26 $5.74 $149.24 $31.52 $819.52 $35.51 $923.26
83 FD503 Ignition Coil 23 $14.96 $344.08 $20.85 $479.55 $57.39 $1,319.97
84 GL407 New Motorcraft Alternator 67 $144.44 $9,677.48 $177.33 $11,881.11 $188.59 $12,635.53
85 HB6054 Halogen Head Lamp 61 $5.61 $342.21 $8.31 $506.91 $9.79 $597.19
86 HST14 Heat Shrink Tubing 70 $0.29 $20.30 $0.63 $44.10 $0.89 $62.30
87 K8283 Idler Arm 33 $21.23 $700.59 $65.51 $2,161.83 $75.47 $2,490.51
88 LP175 Propane Cylinder 23 $5.68 $130.64 $5.70 $131.10 No Bid

89 PFS571 Fuel Pump 22 $154.39 $3,396.58 $227.77 $5,010.94 $334.04 $7,348.88
90 RF258 Coolant Fan Motor 12 $0.94 $11.28 $119.17 $1,430.04 $182.74 $2,192.88
91 STP351 Solderless Terminal 1075 $0.47 $505.25 $0.75 $806.25 $1.05 $1,128.75
92 SW5583 Turn Signal Switch 22 $38.25 $841.50 $58.22 $1,280.84 $51.65 $1,136.30
93 TCP61M Trailer Connector 54 $6.48 $349.92 $12.06 $651.24 $8.60 $464.40
94 RS15 Rubber 15" Strap 96 $0.99 $95.04 $2.63 $252.48 $2.75 $264.00
95 STP352 Wire Terminal 675 $1.00 $675.00 $0.75 $506.25 $1.87 $1,262.25
96 110078 WD-40 360 $6.27 $2,257.20 $5.87 $2,113.20 $6.43 $2,314.80
97 CL10S 5/8" ID Split Wire Loom (by feet) 400 $0.52 $208.00 $0.27 $108.00 $0.33 $132.00

TOTAL EXTENDED COST
(All costs must be included or your bid will be disqualified)

$109,397.90

$97,516.20

$125,433.77

Delivery

Annual Price Adjustment

CPI-U
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