A New Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1220A Buyer: Shelley Crayton
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Sanitary Sewer Fittings & PVC Meter Boxes scrayton@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: October 21, 2021

1. Delivery:
If your Bid is accepted and an agreement is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services s specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may resut in City Terminating your agreement or canceling the
Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitied in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
Bidder must include a manufacturers part number and price for each item listed in each section of exhibit A. Quantities listed are provided based on historical data

Bidders must respond to all items to be considered responsive. Award of bid will be made by the whole section. You must bid all items in this section
to be considered for award.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

The City does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases, if any, that will be made during the agreement period.

Section 1: Sanitary Sewer Fittings Utility Supply Company Core & Main LP Ferguson Waterworks
Couplings Manufacturers Name and Part Manufacturers Name and Part Manufacturers Name and Part
Hem# (See Spectication “SFittingV") Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber
1 Loose Coupling ™" (For ABS Truss Pipe) 50 NO QUOTE $65.00 $3,250.00 CCONTECH 100244SR NO BID
2 [PVC DWV Coupling 4” Sch 40 100 $3.74 $374.00 GPK 305-0004 $4.15 $415.00 GPK 305-0004 $8.36 $836.00 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWVCP
3 PVC DWV Coupling 6 Sch 40 50 $15.46 $773.00 GPK305-0006 $17.00 $850.00 GPK 305.0006 $20.20 $1,460.00 CHARLOTTE PIPE POWVCU
Coupling, Flexible 47 X 4”
4 Clay to Ciay (Fernco 1001-44RC) 1 $17.69 $17.69 GPK IS101-44ASR $18.50 $18.50 FERNCO 1001-44RC $18.20 $18.20 FERNCO F100144RC
Coupling, Flexible 47 X 4”
5 e o aaric) 8 $25.92 $207.36 GPK IS102-44ASR $24.50 $196.00 FERNCO 1002-44RC $52.87 $422.96 FERNCO F100166RC
Coupling, Flexible 47 X 4
6 Gonc. © C.1. (Fernco 1006-44RC) 5 $25.87 $129.35 GPK 1S106-44ASR $25.30 $126.50 FERNCO 1006-44RC $26.62 $133.10 FERNCO F100644RC
Coupling, Flexible 4* X 4* C.1. TO C.L
7 S ey 59 $17.69 $1,043.71 GPKIS156-44ASR $16.75 $988.25 FERNCO 1056-44RC $18.20 $1,073.80 FERNCO F105644RC
Coupling, Flexible 6" X 4" Clay to Clay
8 (Fernco 1001-64RC) 1 $39.21 $39.21 GPK IS101-64AST $38.75 $38.75 FERNCO 1001-64RC $42.19 $42.19 FERNCO F100164RC
Coupling, Flexible 6" X 4° Clay to .l
9 [ 1 $64.53 $64.53 GPK IS102-64ASR $62.00 $62.00 FERNCO 1002-64RC $66.41 $66.41 FERNCO F100264RC
Coupling, Flexible 6" X 6" Concrete. to C.I.
10 (Fernco 1006-66RC) 13 $51.39 $668.07 GPK 1S106-66ASR $49.00 $637.00 FERNCO 1006-66RC $52.87 $687.31 FERNCO F100666RC
" Coupling, Fledble & X6 C...to C. 7 $34.37 $240.59 GPK IS156-66ASR $32.55 $227.85 FERNCO 1056-66RC $34.66 $242.62 FERNCO F105666RC
(Fernco 1056-66RC)
12 Coupling, 8" Clay to D.I. (Omni 441) 4 $175.98 $703.92 ROMAC 501-9.79X9.40XS $118.45 $473.80 SMITH BLAIR 441-09850945-900 $175.40 $701.60 ROMAC R50108300830520
13 Coupling, Clay to D.1. 10" (Omni 441) 2 $242.80 $485.60 ROMAC 501-12.12X11.40X6 $160.00 $320.00 SMITH BLAIR 441-11881160-900 $242.00 $484.00 ROMAC R50110551055600
14 Coupling, Clay to D.I. 12" (Omni 441) 6 $292.01 $1,752.06 ROMAC 501-14.40X13.55X6 $191.00 $1,146.00 SMITH BLAIR 441-14201350-900 $291.05 $1,746.30 ROMAC R501129512956
Bends
fem# Bends . ion “SFitti ) Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “SFittingV”)
ViL Clay 90-degree bend &' BUILDING PRODUCTS
15 oy oo 1 $124.76 $124.76 LOGAN CLAY $350.00 $350.00 M108.6000 $149.53 §149.53 LOGAN CLAY PIPE A0812
16 (o oarep bend 4 wigasket 1 $95.87 $95.87 TYLER PIPE $49.00 $49.00 TYLER 130448 NO BID
1 e oores bend 4 wigasket 1 $104.67 $104.67 TYLER PIPE $49.00 $49.00 TYLER 130498 NO BID
18 ) oo a0 0o o4 10 $5.90 $59.00 GPK 317-0004 $6.30 $63.00 GPK 317-0004 $15.00 $150.00 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWV2P
19 ) ooz 0o bont & 10 $40.28 $402.80 GPK 317-0006 $41.00 $410.00 GPK 317-0006 $86.64 $866.40 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWV2U
2 PVC DWV 45-degree bend 4° (8:8) 35 $6.41 $224.35 GPK 321-0004 $7.15 $250.25 GPK 321-0004 $17.76 $621.60 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWV4D
2 PVC DWV d5-degree bend 6 (8:8) 10 $25.76 $257.60 GPK 321-0006 $24.00 $240.00 GPK 321-0006 $65.62 $656.20 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWV4D
2 PVC DWWV 90-degre bend 4" (8) 60 56.87 $412.20 GPK 323-0004 $7.50 $450.00 GPK 323-0004 52005 $1,203.00 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWY9P
z PVC DWV 50-degree bend 6' (8:8) 7 $25.75 $180.25 GPK 323-0006 $26.15 $183.05 GPK 323-0006 $74.88 $524.16 CHARLOTTE PIPE PDWV9U
20 [CDWYZ2t2degree bend 4" et bend. Schecule 20 $12.50 $250.00 GPK 318-0004 $14.00 $280.00 GPK 318-0004 $21.33 $426.60 CHA%E&E; IPE
2 PV DWV 5-degree bend 4" Stret bend. Schedue 40 20 $6.75 $135.00 GPK 322-0004 $7.45 $149.00 GPK 322-0004 $15.76 $315.20 CHARLOTTE PIPE
» PVC DWWV 45-degree bend 6" Stret bend. Schedule 40 3 $25.75 $77.25 GPK 322-0006 $26.00 $78.00 GPK 322-0006 §77.72 $233.16 vt
z PVC DWV 50-degree bend 4 Steet bend. Schedle 40 2 $11.78 $294.50 GPK 324-0004 $13.00 $325.00 GPK 324-0004 $21.60 $540.00 e
» PVC DWWV 90-degree bend 6" Stret bend. Schedule 40 4 $27.37 $100.48 GPK 324-0006 $27.50 $110.00 GPK 324-0006 $96.58 $386.32 e v
Tees
Tees Manufacturers Name and Part Manufacturers Name and Part Manufacturers Name and Part
em (See Specification “SFittingV") Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber
S BUILDING PRODUCTS [OGAN CLAY PRODUCT
» Vi Clay Tee Extra Lengih & X & X ' 85 $124.76 $10,604.60 LOGAN CLAY $225.00 $19,125.00 08030 $149.53 $12,710.05 082
) Vi Cay Tee Exra Longth &' X' X 6" 20 $124.76 $2.495.20 LOGAN CLAY $225.00 $4,500.00 B o TS $149.53 $2,990.60 LOGAN CL&:RODUCT
S BUILDING PRODUCTS [OGAN CLAY PRODUCT
Bl Vi Clay Tee Extra Lengih & X & X 5 $124.76 $623.80 LOGAN CLAY $225.00 $1,125.00 10880350 $149.53 $747.65 o83
22 |Vi Ciay Tee ExraLongth 10° X 10° X 4" 1 $211.61 $211.61 LOGAN CLAY $240.00 $240.00 B o TS $243.62 $243.62 LOGAN CLAY PRODUCT
em Adaptors . o Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost. Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “SFittingV”) mber
33 Clay to PG Adaptor 4" (Fornco 1002-44) 90 $4.38 $394.20 GPK 1S102-44ASR $4.15 $373.50 FERNCO 1002-44 $4.08 $367.20 FERNCO F100244
2 Clay to PG Adaptor &' (Fornco 1002.66) 20 $9.38 $187.60 GPK 15102-66 $9.00 $180.00 FERNCO 1002-66 $8.74 $174.80 FERNCO F100266
Saddles " - " Manufacturers Name and Part " Manufacturers Name and Part " Manufacturers Name and Part
em (See Specification “SFittingV”) Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber Unit Cost Extended Cost Nomber
35 Reducing Tee Saddle 8" X 4" (For ABS Pipe) 1 $37.92 $37.92 GPK ISST-4 $75.00 $75.00 DFW 4T/C NO BID
tem Clamps “ - Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “SFittingV”")
Glamp, 4" G.L/PVG Romac LSS1
36 i 2 $138.12 $276.24 ROMAC LSS1-4.40X12 $117.25 $234.50 ROMAC LSS1-4.40X12 $135.99 $271.98 ROMAC RSS104401200
Ed ittt 7 $166.19 $1,163.33 ROMAC LSS1-6.35X12 $141.05 $987.35 ROMAC LSS1-6.35X12 $163.61 §1,145.27 ROMAC RSS106351200
38 e st 5 $166.19 $830.95 ROMAC LSS1-7.80X12 $141.05 $705.25 ROMAC LSS1-7.80X12 $163.61 $818.05 ROMAC SP-RSS17175U
3 o sam ! 275 $195.70 $53,817.50 ROMAC L$81-9.95X12 $165.95 $45,636.25 ROMAC LSS1-9.95X12 $190.66 $52,431.50 ROMAC SP-RSS1XRC
@ Clamp, & CLPUC Romac LSS1 7 $195.70 $1,369.90 ROMAC LSS1-8.40X12 $165.95 $1,161.65 ROMAC LSS1-8.39X12 $192.67 $1,348.69 ROMAC RSS108351200
(7.99"- 8.39") X 12° ’ 3 - ’ B ’
@ o ey eSS 5 $241.99 $1,209.95 ROMAC LSS1-11.95X12 $205.00 §1,025.00 ROMAC LSS1-11.95X12 $238.24 $1,191.20 ROMAC R$8111801200
@ e 5 $280.46 $1.402.30 ROMAC LSS1-14.20X12 $238.00 $1,190.00 ROMAC LSS1-14.20X12 $276.11 $1,380.55 ROMAC RSS114301200
« o oo o s 2 $591.36 §1,182.72 ROMAC LSS2-17.90X12 §510.00 §1,020.00 ROMAC LSS2-17.90X12 $582.20 $1,164.40 ROMAC SP-RSS11750
“ orom: oy oo S 2 $647.86 $1,205.72 ROMAC LSS2-21.45X12 $560.00 $1,120.00 ROMAC LSS2-21.45X12 $637.83 $1,275.66 ROMAC SP-R$812105
45 (Cz‘j'gz“ zgscofj Romaclss2 1 $716.78 $716.78 ROMAC LSS2-25.00X12 $615.00 $615.00 ROMAC LSS2-25.00X12 $705.68 $705.68 ROMAC SP-RSS12462



mailto:scrayton@cityoftulsa.org

4% (Cz‘g'?g zgsis‘aj Romacsss 1 $1,043.09 $1,043.09 ROMAC LS83-28.55X12 $900.15 $900.15 ROMAC LS83-28.55X12 $1,026.94 $1,026.94 ROMAC SP-RSS12815
Glamp, 30" Concrete Romac LSS3 POWERSEAL POWERSEAL y
a7 et 1 $1521.94 $1,521.94 31233013120CA $1,130.00 $1,130.00 3123AS308X12 $1,154.86 $1,154.86 ROMAC SP-RSS13180
Sanitary Sewer Pipe
e e on “Spipe’) Estimate Annual Quantity unit cost Extended Cost | Manufacturers Name and Part unit Cost Extended Cost | Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost | Manufacturers Name and Part
48 VIT. Clay Pipe 10", (5.51JT) (Extra Strength) 25 $105.38 $2,634.50 LOGAN CLAY $120.00 $3,000.00 BU'LD%?DUCTS $128.53 $3,213.25 LOGAN CLAY PIPE A1005
49 [vi.ciayPipe 127, 55T) (Extra strengtn) 5 $174.92 $874.60 LOGAN CLAY $150.00 $750.00 BUILDING PRODUCTS $203.86 $1,01930  |LOGAN CLAY PIPE A1206
50 VIT. Clay Pipe 15" (Extra Strength) 5 $373.15 $1,865.75 LOGAN CLAY $300.00 $1,500.00 BU'LDE&EE?DUCTS $418.61 $2,093.05 LOGAN CLAY PIPE A1507
51 8" Clay Bank seat ipe bel end) 1000 $12.69 $12,690.00 LOGAN CLAY $40.00 $40,000.00 BUILDING PRODUCTS $16.62 $16,62000  |LOGAN CLAY PIPE A0805
52 8" x 5' Band Seal (plain end) 1000 $12.69 $12,690.00 LOGAN CLAY $40.00 $40,000.00 BU'LD'“ﬂGBQZESDUCTS NO BID
Item Miscellaneous Sewer Pipe Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “Spipe”)
53 PVC Pipe SDR-35 (For Sewer Only) 50 $10.00 $500.00 DIAMOND PLASTIC $2.30 $115.00 JM EAGLE 04043514 NO BID
54 PVC Pipe Sch-40 SP-SP (for Sewer) 4" 50 $5.50 $275.00 SILVERLINE $4.50 $225.00 JM EAGLE 0504040 $108.00 $5,400.00 CH’;RL; EOETETEEZPEIPE
) CHARLOTTE PIPE
55 PVC Pipe Sch-40 SP-SP (for Sewer) 6 60 $9.50 $570.00 SILVERLINE $6.95 $417.00 JM EAGLE 0506040 $204.26 $12,255.60 DAOREPLO
56 C.. Soil Pipe 4" (B-SP) 1 $200.00 $200.00 TYLER PIPE $200.00 $200.00 TYLER 1304SHS $16.30 $16.30 CHAF;LF?J;% PIPE
57 C.1. Pipe 18" (For sewer only) (W205) 1 $600.00 $600.00 DIAMOND PLASTIC $195.00 $195.00 US PIPE 11850T401 NO BID
Extended Cost, Section 1 Total: $122,512.02 $179,481.60 $135,752.86
Section 2: PVC Meter Boxes
tom  [FVC Meter Boves  etercan Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
1 White Meter Cans Fits 1 Meters 120 $162.22 $19,466.40 EGW 61271 $150.00 $18,000.00 EGW WRMC2418 $124.44 $14,932.80 EGW EWRMC1824
2 White Meter Cans Fits 2° Meters 1 $398.89 $398.89 EGW 43858 $390.00 $390.00 EGW WRMC3636 $137.78 $137.78 EGW EWRMC1836
Extended Cost, Section 2 Total: $19,865.29 $18,390.00 $15,070.58
TOTAL COST (SECTIONS 1 & 2)
i will be disquali $142,377.31 $197,871.60 $150,823.44
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)
" Stock to 15 days under normal market conditions with the
Deliver - M . . -
" Stock - 16 Weeks uncertainty in the market shipments will be delayed 60-90 Days
ANNUAL PRICE ADJUSTMENT Fixed 10% Fixed 15%
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