Buyer: Shelley Crayton
scrayton@cityoftulsa.org

TAC 071D

Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Asset Management Department
Bid Date: October 27, 2022

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor
Tulsa, OK 74103

1. Delivery:
If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

Deliveries shall be made to the various locations in the City of Tulsa listed in these specifications, and the city reserves the right to add other locations or delete locations during the term of the
contract without affecting the contract price.

2. Pricing

Prices bid for unleaded gasolines and ULSD products shall e based on the "Oil Price Information Service" close of day publication wholesale rack average posting. Prices bid for Bio-Diesel shall
be based on the "ASTM D6751" publication posting weekly nearest to the delivery date.

The Bidder(s) will be required to furnish

(a) the applicable product publications to the city with theis bid submission
(b) be required to provice applicable product publications to the City with each invoice.

All product publications are at no additional cost to the City.

BID CONSTANT:

The Bid Constant is the amount per gallon the Bidder(s) submits as a constant price which together with the "OPIS" Daily Rack Average Price per gallon plus the required regulatory taxes/fees is

the total cost to the City on any givewn day for product that is delivered to the City of Tulsa. All products must read four (4) decimal points to the right.

Pick-up and Delivery costs must be included in the bid price.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

The City does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases, if any, that will be made during the agreement period

Please contact if You have any questions

Mansfield Oil petrol Trad Pi le Petrol
etroleum lraders Innacle Petroleum
TRANSPORT LOAD - BID CONSTANT QT Fuels Incorporated SC Fuels TACenergy, LLC Company of . ! Offen Petroleum
. . Corporation Inc.
Gainesville, Inc.
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Item Description Quantity above or below Cost above or below Cost above or below Cost above or below Cost above or below Cost above or below Cost above or below Cost
(+or-) (+or-) (+or-) (+or-) (+or-) (+or-) (+or-)

1 Unleaded Gasoline (Coventional or E10) - minimum 87 Octane 1,400,000 gals* -$0.0050 -$7,000.00 -$0.0004 -$560.00 $0.0278 $38,920.00 -$0.0002 -$280.00 $0.0045 $6,300.00 -$0.01749 -$24,486.00 -$0.0101 -$14,140.00

2 uLsD 840,000 gals* -$0.0050 -$4,200.00 $0.0205 $17,220.00 $0.0354 $29,736.00 $0.0046 $3,864.00 $0.0063 $5,292.00 -$0.00698 -$5,863.20 -$0.0101 -$8,484.00

3 B5 Diesel Fuel 30,000 gals* N/A Not Available N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A

4 B10 Diesel Fuel (by request only) 30,000 gals* N/A Not Available N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Total Annual Cost - Transport Load
T il b disqualic) -§11,200.00 $16,660.00 $68,656.00 $3,584.00 $11,592.00 -$30,349.20 -§22,624.00

Delivery: 90 Days 1 Business Day Between 14 to 28 days, Typical delivery in 24 to 48 hours Two (2) business days 1 Day
(2 to 4 weeks)
Annual Price Adjustment: Use CPI Fixed 5%
% discount off invoice 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
If Payment received withing days. 10 Days 30 Days 10 Days N/A 30 Days N/A 0 Days
Pump off fee will be chaged as
Notes separate line item fon invoices.
Fee: $100.00
*Estimated Annual Usae for evaluation purposes only.
**OPIS is the Oil Price Information Service. "Wholesale" is the current OPIS "Rack Average” Price for this market
***AF| is the Alternative Fuel Index, a weekly benchmark for alternative fuels.
Item Description - Applicable Taxes Unit Cost Per Gallon

1 Federal Gas/ULSD #2 Spill Tax Per Gallon $0.001929/$0.002143

2 Federal L.U.S.T. Tax Per Gallon $0.001000

3 Oklahoma UST Gas/ULSD #2 Tax Per Gallon $0.001000
The City would like to take advantage of any prompt payment discount. If you offer such a discount, please provide the % discount and the time
requirement for receipt of payment. This will not be considered in the bid evaluation.
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