
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1177B Buyer: Angie Tune
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor High-Pressure Sewer Cleaner and Vacuum atune@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 741023 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Date: December 15, 2022

2. Pricing

Item Description Estimated Annual Qty Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1 66,000 LB GVW Dual Rear Wheel Cab Chassis. High Pressure 
Sewer Cleaner and Vacuum Unit.

1 $604,239.00 $604,239.00 $690,672.00 $690,672.00

1 Automatic rear differential lock for rear axles. 1 N/A N/A

2a Pipe Wolf Nozzle Part #1-0321-6020-C or Equivalent. 1 $3,243.00 $3,243.00 $3,243.00 $3,243.00

2b 3-inch General Purpose Nozzle Part #58929 or Equivalent. 1 $686.00 $686.00 $686.00 $686.00

2c Chisel Nozzle Part #1-0212-8020-C or Equivalent. 1 $721.00 $721.00 $721.00 $721.00

2d Wart Hog Part #WGR MAGNUM Nozzle or Equivalent 1 $5,192.00 $5,192.00 $5,192.00 $5,192.00

2e Agitator Nozzle Part #49002 BJC or Equivalent. 1 $642.00 $642.00 $642.00 $642.00

3 Training of the product and any additional training that is 
needed shall be provided at no cost the  City of Tulsa

1 Included Included Included Included

4 Hose Repair Tool. Aeroquip Model #FT-1282 or Equivalent 1 $9,293.00 $9,293.00 $9,293.00 $9,293.00

5 Extended Warranty on Truck Cab & Chassis for 5 years or 
150,000 miles.

1 $4,926.00 $4,926.00

6 Extended Warranty on entire High-Pressure Cleaner Module. 
Price shall include all Parts and Labor

6a Three (3) year Extended Warranty 1 $11,130.00 $11,130.00 $11,130.00 $11,130.00

6b Five (5) year Extended Warranty 1 $23,148.00 $23,148.00 $23,148.00 $23,148.00

7 Preventative Maintenance Agreement. Preventative 
maintenance to be done on 180 day intervals

7a Three (3) year Agreement 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7b Five (5) year Agreement 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7c Ten (10) year Agreement 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 360 Degree Exterior Camera System 1 $6,786.00 $6,786.00 $6,786.00 $6,786.00

Notes: J&R Equipment will need a PO# no later than 90 Days to 
honor this delivery date.

$756,439.00

Holt Truck Centers of Oklahoma LLC

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                      
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

1. Delivery: 

J & R Equipment LLC

$665,080.00

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as 
well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

If you Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

Options

Delivery:

Annual Price Adjustment:

Estimated Delivery of completed unit, October 2023

Note: No Bid One Time Price Only***

485 Days ARO Chassis / 365 Days After Rec Chassis for Body, 
Total 850 Days to Delivery

Note: No Bid One Time Price Only***
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