
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department Senior Buyer: Samantha J. Toothaker TAC 446J Secondary Source - Safety Footwear Program

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor stoothaker@cityoftulsa.org Human Resources Department

Tulsa, OK 74103 Please contact if you have any questions. Bid Opening Date: June 12, 2025

 

Bidder's Legal Name:

Delivery:  
If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to 
deliver the Supplies and/or begin providing Services.

Pricing: Section 1 – Footwear by Category

Item Footwear Category
Size 

Range
Width 
Range Model#

List 
Price % off

Discounted 
Price

Est. 
Qty 

Extended 
Discounted 

Price
Size 

Range
Width 
Range Model#

List 
Price % off

Discounted 
Price

Est. 
Qty 

Extended 
Discounted 

Price

1 Men’s Safety Toe Low Cut Athletic Shoe Lace Up 8-18 4E & 6E RB5440 $129.99 15% $110.49 50 $5,524.50 7-15 D-EE AR0040283 $114.99 10% $103.49 50 $5,174.50

2 Men’s Safety Toe Low Cut Athletic Shoe Slip On 4-14 W K10119 $119.99 15% $101.99 35 $3,569.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 35 NO BID

3 Men’s Safety Toe High Top Athletic Shoe Lace Up 6-15 M & W RB8894 $169.99 15% $144.49 15 $2,167.35 8-14 M-W ROC02173 $119.99 10% $107.99 15 $1,619.85

4 Men’s Safety Toe Low Cut Work Shoe Leather Upper Lace Up 4-14 W K10751 $119.99 15% $101.99 40 $4,079.60 7-15 D-EE XMDMXN01 $129.99 10% $116.99 40 $4,679.60

5 Men’s Safety Toe Low Cut Work Shoe Leather Upper Slip On 4-14 W K10781 $119.99 15% $101.99 30 $3,059.70 7-14 D-EE XMCAN001 $159.99 10% $143.99 30 $4,319.70

6 Men’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Leather Upper Lace Up 4-14 W K13751 $129.99 15% $110.49 100 $11,049.00 7-15 D-EE AR0046876 $179.99 10% $161.99 100 $16,199.00

7 Men’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Leather Upper Slip On 7-14 M & W 20004 $159.99 15% $135.99 75 $10,199.25 7-14 D-EE AR10024983 $159.99 10% $143.99 75 $10,799.25

8 Men’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Lace Up 7-14 M & W CA1916 $139.99 15% $118.99 60 $7,139.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 60 NO BID

9 Men’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Slip On 7-14 D & EE A7030 $129.99 15% $110.49 10 $1,104.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 10 NO BID

10 Men’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Leather Upper Lace Up 4-14 W K14781 $139.99 15% $118.99 10 $1,189.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 10 NO BID

11 Men’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Leather Upper Slip On 4-14 W K15782 $149.99 15% $127.49 75 $9,561.75 7-15 D-EE AR0044544 $204.99 10% $184.49 75 $13,836.75

12 Men’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Lace Up 6-15 M & W RB8874 $169.99 15% $144.49 20 $2,889.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 20 NO BID

13 Men’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Slip On 5-14 M  CHS000A $159.99 15% $135.99 15 $2,039.85 5-15 M CHS000A $139.99 10% $125.99 15 $1,889.85

14 Women’s Safety Toe Low Cut Athletic Shoe Lace Up 6-12 M & W RB248 $119.99 15% $101.99 25 $2,549.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 25 NO BID

15 Women’s Safety Toe Low Cut Athletic Shoe Slip On 6-12 W VM30802F $119.99 15% $101.99 30 $3,059.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 30 NO BID

16 Women’s Safety Toe High Top Athletic Shoe Lace Up 6-11 M & W CA1944 $139.99 15% $118.99 10 $1,189.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 10 NO BID

17 Women’s Safety Toe Low Cut Work Shoe Leather Upper Lace Up 4-14 W K10751 $119.99 15% $101.99 15 $1,529.85 5.5-11 B XWXCA002 $129.99 10% $116.99 15 $1,754.85

18 Women’s Safety Toe Low Cut Work Shoe Leather Upper Slip On 4-14 W K10781 $119.99 15% $101.99 10 $1,019.90 5.5-11 B XWDMXN02 $129.99 10% $116.99 10 $1,169.90

19 Women’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Leather Upper Lace Up 5-12 M & W WDMST01 $149.99 15% $127.49 60 $7,649.40 5.5-12 B AR0053821 $159.99 10% $143.99 60 $8,639.40

20 Women’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Leather Upper Slip On 4-14 W K13411 $139.99 15% $118.99 5 $594.95 5-11 B JUGY9980 $119.99 10% $107.99 5 $539.95

21 Women’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Lace Up 6-12 M & W CA1945 $139.99 15% $118.99 10 $1,189.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 10 NO BID

22 Women’s Safety Toe Mid Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Slip On 5-11 B 10050845 $139.99 15% $118.99 5 $594.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 5 NO BID

23 Women’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Leather Upper Lace Up 4-14 W K13751 $129.99 15% $110.49 15 $1,657.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 15 NO BID

24 Women’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Leather Upper Slip On 4-14 W K15782 $149.99 15% $127.49 15 $1,912.35 5.5-12 B-C AR0050827 $169.99 10% $152.99 15 $2,294.85

25 Women’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Lace Up 5-12 M & W RB864 $119.99 15% $101.99 5 $509.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 5 NO BID

26 Women’s Safety Toe High Top Work Boot Synthetic Upper Slip On 5-14 M CHS000A $159.99 15% $135.99 10 $1,359.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NB NO BID 10 NO BID

TOTAL EXTENDED COST NOT TO EXCEED:  (All costs must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified) $88,392.50

Section 2 – Discount Percentage

15% 10%

Gellco Uniforms & Shoes, Inc.
Cavendar Sotres, L.P. dba Cavender's Boot City, dba 

Cavendar's

Days:  0 Days:  0-7

Description:
City of Tulsa’s Discount Off List Price for other Safety Footwear not listed in 
Section 1.

CavendarsGellco Uniforms & Shoes Inc.

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid.  Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other 
damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity. 

At the sole discretion of the City, sections of this IFB may be awarded to multiple sellers.  Any listed quantities are estimates and used for Bid evaluation purposes only.  No guarantee of minimum or maximum quantities to be 
purchased is made by the City of Tulsa under this IFB.

Annual Price Adjustment CPI 10%

Notes

$72,917.45


