
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1212C Buyer: Julie Miller

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water Fittings jamiller@cityoftulsa.org

Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions.

Bid Opening Date: March 5, 2026

If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or begin providing Services.

ITEM SERVICE FITTINGS 5/8" & 3/4"
Est. Yearly

Qty
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

1
Coupling C to C 3/4” (Nibco #600)

35 $1.65 $57.75 BMI 37005 $1.96 $68.60 NIBCO 600-DS

2 Service Coupling 3/4” (Ford C44-33) 300 $18.15 $5,445.00 FORD C44-33NL $18.22 $5,466.00 FORD C44-33-NL

3
Brass Corporation Plug 5/8" (Mueller 

H10033)
25 $14.85 $371.25 FORD CSP-2-A-NL $14.89 $372.25 FORD CSP-2-A-NL

4 Curb Stop 3/4" full port (Muller B20283-3) 1800 $52.95 $95,310.00 FORD B11-333WRNL $53.18 $95,724.00 FORD B11-333W-NL

5
Service Clamp 2” X 5/8” (S/B 311-025605)-

Saddle 
20 $13.45 $269.00 SMITH BLAIR 311-025605-000 $13.56 $271.20

SMITH BLAIR 311-

0025605-000

6
Service Clamp 2” X 3/4” (Mueller 

DE1A0235CC075)-Saddle
125 $13.45 $1,681.25 SMITH BLAIR 311-025606-000 $13.56 $1,695.00

SMITH BLAIR 311-

00025607-000

7
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8” x 3/4" x 3/4” 

Meter Swivel Nut by ¾ Male Iron pipe thread 
1900 $14.25 $27,075.00 FORD L35-23NL $14.29 $27,151.00 FORD L38-23-NL

8
Meter Yoke (7” rise) 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

B24118)
1200 $127.00 $152,400.00 FORD VB42-7W $127.43 $152,916.00 FORD VB42-7W-FP-NL

9
Meter Yoke (12” rise) 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

B24118) 
300 $131.30 $39,390.00 FORD VB42-12W $131.73 $39,519.00 FORD VB42-12W-FP-NL

10
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8“X 3/4” X 

3/4“(Mueller H14200) 
100 $19.95 $1,995.00 FORD L32-23NL $19.94 $1,994.00 FORD L32-23-NL

11
Angle Meter Curb Stop 5/8” X 3/4” X 3/4” 

(Mueller B24255)
600 $73.35 $44,010.00 FORD BA23-332WNL $73.63 $44,178.00 FORD BA23-232W-NL

12
Corporation Stop 3/4" X 3/4“ (Mueller 

H15000) 
350 $31.35 $10,972.50 FORD F600-3NL $31.46 $11,011.00 FORD F600-3-NL 

13
Corporation Stop 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

H15000) 
150 $30.00 $4,500.00 FORD F600-23NL $30.12 $4,518.00 FORD F600-23-NL

14
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” (Mueller 

H15068) 90 Degree
400 $19.75 $7,900.00 FORD 602-33NL $19.79 $7,916.00 FORD L02-33-NL

15
Two Branch Connection 3/4" X 1” (Mueller 

H15340) 
10 $36.20 $362.00 FORD Y22-243NL $36.31 $363.10 FORD Y22-243-NL

16
Three Part Union 3/4” (Mueller H-15400)

250 $16.80 $4,200.00 FORD C22-33NL $16.82 $4,205.00 FORD C22-33-NL

Utility Supply Co.

 Delivery: 

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing 

collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity

 Pricing: 

Core & Main LP

mailto:jamiller@cityoftulsa.org


17 Straight Coupling 3/4” (Mueller H15425) 50 $13.30 $665.00 FORD C28-33NL $13.31 $665.50 FORD C28-33-NL

18
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8” x 3/4” (Mueller 

H15490)
125 $20.80 $2,600.00 FORD L102-23NL $20.84 $2,605.00 FORD L102-23-NL

19
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” x 3/4” (Mueller 

H15490)
40 $19.95 $798.00 FORD L102-33NL $19.97 $798.80 FORD L102-33-NL

20
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” (Mueller 

H15530)
125 $14.30 $1,787.50 FORD L28-33NL $14.26 $1,782.50 FORD L28-33-NL

21
Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-Deg. 3/4" (BMI)

1900 $8.30 $15,770.00 BRECCO 400-100-01050 $9.99 $18,981.00 BMI 06375

22
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 2” 

(McDonald 4620)
35 $9.70 $339.50 FORD C38-23-2NL $9.72 $340.20 FORD C38-23-2-NL

23
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 2-1/2” 

(McDonald 4620
30 $9.70 $291.00 FORD C38-23-2-5NL $9.72 $291.60 FORD C38-23-2-5-NL

24
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 1-1/2” 

(McDonald 4620H)
30 $11.05 $331.50 FORD  C38-23-1-SAL $11.05 $331.50 FORD C38-23-1-5-NL

25
Meter Angle Ball Supply Stop Valve

Lead Fre 3/4“(McDonald 74604B) 
25 $37.60 $940.00 FORD BA13-232WNL $68.90 $1,722.50 BA 13-332W-NL

Item # FITTINGS 1"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

26 Service Coupling 1” (Ford C44-44) 40 $20.80 $832.00 FORD C44-44NL $20.84 $833.60 FORD C44-44-NL

27 Corporation Stop 1“ (Mueller H9971) 40 $43.95 $1,758.00 FORD F200-4NL $44.12 $1,764.80 FORD F200-4-NL

28 Brass Corporation Plug 1” (Mueller H10033) 3 $12.65 $37.95 FORD SCP-4-A-NL $12.65 $37.95 FORD CSP-4-A-NL

29 Curb Stop 1" Full Port (Mueller B20283-3) 35 $81.55 $2,854.25 FORD B11-444WNL $81.93 $2,867.55 FORD B11-444W-NL

30
Service Clamp 2” X 1” (Mueller 

DE2A0235CC100) 
10 $13.45 $134.50 SMITH BLAIR 311-025606-000 $13.56 $135.60

SMITH BLAIR 311-

00025609-000

31 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H10892) 40 $20.30 $812.00 FORD L38-44NL $20.38 $815.20 FORD L38-44-NL

32 Meter Yoke (12” Rise) 1” (Mueller B24118) 35 $230.65 $8,072.75 FORD VB44-12W $231.31 $8,095.85 FORD VB44-12W-FP-NL

33 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H14200) 15 $30.36 $455.40 FORD L32-44NL $30.45 $456.75 FORD L32-44-NL

34 Angle Meter Curb Stop 1” (Mueller B24255) 115 $109.40 $12,581.00 FORD BA23-444NL $109.89 $12,637.35 FORD BA23-444W-NL

35 Three Part Union 1” (Mueller H15400) 40 $29.35 $1,174.00 FORD C22-44NL $29.43 $1,177.20 FORD C22-44-NL

36 Straight Coupling 1” X 3/4” (Mueller H15425) 10 $20.25 $202.50 FORD C28-43NL $20.29 $202.90 FORD C38-43-NL

37 Straight Coupling 1” X 1” (Mueller H15425) 7 $18.95 $132.65 FORD C28-44NL $19.01 $133.07 FORD C28-44

38 Straight Coupling 1” X 1” (Mueller H15450) 13 $20.04 $260.52 FORD C21-44NL $20.09 $261.17 FORD C21-44-NL

39
Straight Corp. Stop Coupling 1” (Mueller 

H15480)
5 $29.65 $148.25 FORD CL102-44NL $29.75 $148.75 FORD C102-44-NL

40 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H15490) 25 $33.30 $832.50 FORD L102-44NL $33.42 $835.50 FORD L102-44-NL

41 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H15530) 25 $23.58 $589.50 FORD L28-44NL $23.66 $591.50 FORD L28-44-NL

42 Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-DEG 1" (BMI) 50 $13.30 $665.00 BRECCO 400-100-010-51 $16.46 $823.00 BMI 06376

43
Meter Angle Ball Supply Stop Valve 1” 

(McDonald 74604B)
25 $103.35 $2,583.75 FORD BA13-444NL $103.82 $2,595.50 FORD BA 13-444W-NL

Item # FITTINGS 1 1/2"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

44 Coupling w/Stop C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #600) 1 $7.00 $7.00 BMI 37008 $8.69 $8.69 NIBCO 600



45
Female Adaptor C to F.S.P.S. 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#603) 
1 $18.15 $18.15 BMI 37708 $29.38 $29.38 NIBCO 603

46
Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#604)
1 $14.65 $14.65 BMI 37808 $18.80 $18.80 NIBCO 604

47 Elbow 45-Degree C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #606) 1 $10.25 $10.25 BMI37208 $16.01 $16.01 NIBCO 606

48 Elbow 90-Degree C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #607) 2 $10.25 $20.50 BMI37308 $15.82 $31.64 NIBCO 607

49
Elbow 90-Degree Street 1-1/2” (Nibco #607-

2)
1 $12.50 $12.50 BMI 37358 $20.27 $20.27 NIBCO 607-2

50
Elbow 90-Degree C to F.S.P.S 1- 1/2” (Nibco 

#707-3) 
1 $14.00 $14.00 BMI 353283 $77.26 $77.26 NIBCO 707-3

51
Elbow 90-Degree C to M.S.P.S 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#707-4) 
1 $12.00 $12.00 BMI 353863 $137.38 $137.38 NIBCO 707-4

52 Service Coupling 1-1/2” (Ford C44-66) 20 $69.43 $1,388.60 FORD C44-66NL $69.75 $1,395.00 FORD C44-66-NL

53 Corporation Stop 1-1/2” (Mueller H10003) 15 $129.95 $1,949.25 FORD FB800-6NL $130.58 $1,958.70 FORD FB800-6-NL

54
Brass Corporation Plug 1-1/2" (Mueller 

H10033)
2 $34.10 $68.20 FORD CSP-6-A-NL $34.20 $68.40 FORD CSP-6-A-NL

55
Quarter Bend Coupling 1-1/2" (Mueller 

H10096) 
16 $195.00 $3,120.00 FORD L18-875NL $42.23 $675.68 FORD L76S-NL

56
Service Clamp 4” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A0500CC150) 
2 $39.80 $79.60 SMITH BLAIR 313-051413-000 $40.18 $80.36

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00051413-000

57
Service Clamp 6” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A0659CC150)
7 $35.95 $251.65 SMITH BLAIR 313-069013-000 $36.27 $253.89

SMITH BLAIR 

31300069013-000

58
Service Clamp 8” X 1-1/2”(Mueller 

DR2A0854CC150)
5 $42.90 $214.50 SMITH BLAIR 313-090513-000 $43.40 $217.00

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00121213-000

59
Service Clamp 10” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A1064CC150) 
1 $56.90 $56.90 SMITH BLAIR 313-121213-000 $57.44 $57.44

SMITH BLAIR 313-

0090513-000

60
Service Clamp 12” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A1262CC150)
3 $66.85 $200.55 SMITH BLAIR 313-143213-000 $67.51 $202.53

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00143213-000

61
Service Clamp 16" X 1-1/2" (Mueller

DR2A1740CC150) 
1 $108.00 $108.00 SMITH BLAIR 313-178013-000 $109.05 $109.05

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00178013-000

62 Brass Coupling (Collar) 1-1/2” (Ford C4466) 4 $69.45 $277.80 FORD C44-66NL $69.75 $279.00 FORD C44-66-NL 

63
Bronze Meter Flange, Female 1-1/2” (Ford 

#6) 
2 $43.10 $86.20 FORD CF31-66NL $43.26 $86.52 Ford CF31-66-NL

64 angle Meter Curb Stop 1” (Mueller B24255) 1 $46.53 $46.53 FORD CF38-66-2-NL $46.72 $46.72 Ford CF38-66-NL

Item # FITTINGS 2"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

65 Nipple, Brass 2” X 1-1/2” CL NL 100 $15.95 $1,595.00 BRECCO 550-200-01160 $12.50 $1,250.00 MIDLAND IND 40160

66 Nipple, Brass 2” X 8” NL 100 $50.00 $5,000.00 BRECCO 550-200-01260 $62.44 $6,244.00 BMI 04990

67 Nipple, Brass 2” X 10” NL 100 $61.75 $6,175.00 BRECCO 550-200-01280 $77.87 $7,787.00 BMI 04992

68 Coupling with Stop C to C 2” (Nibco #600) 2 $9.15 $18.30 BMI 37009 $14.49 $28.98 NIBCO 600

69 Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 2” (Nibco #604) 1 $19.00 $19.00 BMI37809 $31.81 $31.81 NIBCO 604

70 Elbow, 45-Degree C to C 2” (Nibco #606) 1 $16.55 $16.55 BMI 37209 $26.73 $26.73 NIBCO 606

71 Elbow, Brass 90-Degree. No lead. 100 $32.00 $3,200.00 BRECCO 400-100-01008 $38.17 $3,817.00 BMI 06309

72 Elbow, 90-Degree C to C 2” (Nibco #607) 7 $17.85 $124.95 BMI 37309 $28.82 $201.74 NIBCO 607

73
Elbow, 90-Degree C to M.S.P.S. 2” (Nibco 

#707-4) 
1 $12.00 $12.00 BMI 353900 $134.67 $134.67 NIBCO 707-4

74 Service Coupling 2” (Ford #C44-77) 9 $93.76 $843.84 FORD C44-77NL $94.16 $847.44 FORD C44-77-NL



75 Corporation Stop 2” (Mueller H10003) 30 $221.70 $6,651.00 FORD FB800-7NL $222.70 $6,681.00 FORD FB800-7-NL

76 Brass Corporation Plug 2" (Mueller H10033) 2 $58.43 $116.86 FORD CSP-7-A-NL $58.67 $117.34 FORD CSP-7-A-NL

77 Brass Corporation Plug 2" (Mueller H10035) 2 $53.32 $106.64 FORD SCP-7-1-NL $53.49 $106.98 FORD CSP-7-I-NL

78
Brass Sq. HD Core Plug 2” NL

100 $15.00 $1,500.00 BRECCO 400-100-01194 $17.65 $1,765.00 BMI 06609

79 Quarter Bend Coupling 2” (Mueller H10096) 15 $195.00 $2,925.00 FORD L18-875NL $160.81 $2,412.15 FORD L18-875-NL

80
Service Clamp 4” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0500CC200) 
1 $39.80 $39.80 SMITH BLAIR 313-051415-000 $40.18 $40.18

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00051415-000

81
Service Clamp 6” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0659CC200) 
5 $36.20 $181.00 SMITH BLAIR 313-069015-000 $36.53 $182.65

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00069015-000

82
Service Clamp 8” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0905CC200) 
5 $43.50 $217.50 SMITH BLAIR 313-090515-000 $43.88 $219.40

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00090515-000

83
Service Clamp 10” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1064CC200)
1 $56.95 $56.95 SMITH BLAIR 313-121215-000 $57.44 $57.44

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00121215-000

84
Service Clamp 12” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1262CC200) 
6 $68.20 $409.20 SMITH BLAIR 313-143215-000 $68.86 $413.16

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00143215-000

85
Service Clamp 16” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1740CC200)
2 $112.80 $225.60 SMITH BLAIR 313-178015-000 $113.89 $227.78

SMITH BLAIR 313-

00178015-000

86 Brass Coupling (Collar) 2" (Ford 400352) 20 $116.70 $2,334.00 FORD C44-77NL $94.16 $1,883.20 FORD C44-77-NL

87 Brass Reducer 2-1/2" X 2" (Bell Reducer) 20 $49.10 $982.00 BRECCO 400-100-01154 $64.56 $1,291.20 BMI 06046

88 Brass Bushing 2” X 1-1/2” NL 100 $17.15 $1,715.00 BRECCO 400-100-01238 $19.97 $1,997.00 BMI 06140

89 Brass Bushing 3” X 2” 100 $51.85 $5,185.00 BRECCOO 400-100-01244 $58.68 $5,868.00 BMI 06152

90 Brass Reducer 3” X 2” 100 $71.85 $7,185.00 BRECCO 400-100-01156 $109.25 $10,925.00 BMI 06052

91 Bronze Meter Flange Female 2” (Ford #7) 6 $56.30 $337.80 FORD CF31-77NL $56.47 $338.82 FORD CF31-77-NL

92 Bronze Meter Flange Male 2” (Ford #7M) 1 $62.10 $62.10 FORD CF38-77-2-125NL $62.34 $62.34
FORD CF38-77-2-125-

NL

Item # Fittings, ProPress Compression

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

93
90-Degree Street Bend C to M 1- 1/2” X 1-

1/2” (Only Viega #77522) 
20 $64.75 $1,295.00 VIEGA 77067 $65.48 $1,309.60 VIEGA 79565

94
90-Degree Street Bend C to M 2” X 2” (Only 

Viega #77527) 
40 $88.60 $3,544.00 VIEGA 77072 $103.93 $4,157.20 VIEGA 79570

95
45-Degree Bend C to C 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77627) 
20 $48.00 $960.00 VIEGA 77038 $32.71 $654.20 VIEGA 77038

96
45-Degree Bend C to C 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77632) 
30 $72.70 $2,181.00 VIEGA 77043 $45.37 $1,361.10 VIEGA 77043

97
90-Degree Bend C to C 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#77377)
50 $57.15 $2,857.50 VIEGA 77377 $38.23 $1,911.50 VIEGA 77037

98
90-Degree Bend C to C 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77342) 
60 $84.00 $5,040.00 VIEGA 77072 $53.68 $3,220.80 VIEGA 77042

99
90-Degree Bend C to F 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77562)
10 $97.00 $970.00 VIEGA 79565 $65.48 $654.80 VIEGA 76565

100
90-Degree Bend C to F 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77567) 
5 $159.00 $795.00 VIEGA 79570 $103.93 $519.65 VIEGA 79570

101 TEE C X C X C 1-1/2” (Only Viega #77457) 1 $49.00 $49.00 VIEGA 77457 $49.96 $49.96 VIEGA 77457

102 TEE C X C X C 2” (Only Viega #77477) 1 $60.00 $60.00 VIEGA 77477 $61.71 $61.71 VIEGA 77477

103
Reducer C X C 2” X 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#78167)
10 $36.15 $361.50 VIEGA 78167 $37.44 $374.40 VIEGA 78167

104
Male Adaptor C X M 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77872)
30 $56.80 $1,704.00 VIEGA 79275 $63.41 $1,902.30 VIEGA 79415



105
Male Adaptor C X M 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77877)
75 $107.00 $8,025.00 VIEGA 79290 $93.32 $6,999.00 VIEGA 79420

106
Coupling C X C w/o Stop 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#78192) 
50 $26.00 $1,300.00 VIEGA 78192 $27.20 $1,360.00 VIEGA 78192

107
Coupling C X C w/o Stop 2” (Only Viega 

#78197)
100 $29.15 $2,915.00 VIEGA 78197 $31.06 $3,106.00 VIEGA 78197

Item # Fittings, Tectite Push-Fit
Est. Yearly

Qty
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

108
BRS Coupling w/st C X C 3/4” (Only Tectite 

200) 
200 $10.65 $2,130.00 TECTITE 10155454 $21.14 $4,228.00 TECTITE 200

109
BRS Female Adaptor C X F 3/4” (Only 

Tectite 203) 
300 $8.55 $2,565.00 TECTITE 10155464 $9.68 $2,904.00 TECTITE 203

110
BRS Male Adaptor C X M 3/4” (Only Tectite 

204) 
450 $8.55 $3,847.50 TECTITE 10155470 $12.06 $5,427.00 TECTITE 204

111
BRS 90-Degree Bend C X C 3/4” (Only 

Tectite 207) 
375 $12.05 $4,518.75 TECTITE 10155478 $24.68 $9,255.00 TECTITE 207

112 BRS Tee C X C X C 3/4" (Only Tectite 211) 40 $16.45 $658.00 TECTITE 10155488 $32.42 $1,296.80 TECTITE 211

113
BRS Coupling w/st C X C 1” (Only Tectite 

200) 
50 $26.15 $1,307.50 TECTITE 10155456 $25.64 $1,282.00 TECTITE 200

114
BRS Female Adaptor C X F 1” (Only Tectite 

203) 
45 $21.30 $958.50 TECTITE 10155466 $20.17 $907.65 TECTITE 203

115
BRS Male Adaptor C X M 1” (Only Tectite 

204) 
50 $21.30 $1,065.00 TECTITE 10155472 $23.33 $1,166.50 TECTITE 204

116
BRS 90 Degree Bend C X C1” (Only Tectite 

207) 
60 $28.15 $1,689.00 TECTITE 10155482 $40.69 $2,441.40 TECTITE 207

117 BRS Tee C X C X C 1” (Only Tectite 211 5 $38.35 $191.75 TECTITE 10155496 $48.37 $241.85 TECTITE 211

ITEM SERVICE FITTINGS 5/8" & 3/4"
Est. Yearly

Qty
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

1
Coupling C to C 3/4” (Nibco #600)

35 $1.24 $43.40 Nibco #600 $1.80 $63.00 Nibco-CSCF

2 Service Coupling 3/4” (Ford C44-33) 300 $18.15 $5,445.00 A.Y McDonald 5140-111 $18.50 $5,550.00 Mueller-P15403 250N

3
Brass Corporation Plug 5/8" (Mueller 

H10033)
25 $22.74 $568.50 A.Y McDonald 5126-101 $20.27 $506.75 Mueller- 010033 200N

4 Curb Stop 3/4" full port (Muller B20283-3) 1800 $52.44 $94,392.00 A.Y McDonald 5131-198 $53.19 $95,742.00 Mueller - 020283 325N

5
Service Clamp 2” X 5/8” (S/B 311-025605)-

Saddle 
20 $20.63 $412.60 Smith Blair 311-00025605-000 $17.49 $349.80 S/B-311-00025605-000

6
Service Clamp 2” X 3/4” (Mueller 

DE1A0235CC075)-Saddle
125 $20.63 $2,578.75 Smith Blair 311-0025607-000 $14.00 $1,750.00

Mueller- 

DR1A0235CC075

7
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8” x 3/4" x 3/4” 

Meter Swivel Nut by ¾ Male Iron pipe thread 
1900 $14.24 $27,056.00 A.Y McDonald 5122-121 $15.00 $28,500.00 Mueller- 010892 215N

Ferguson Enterprieses, LLC

2-4 Weeks

6%

N/A

Consolidated Pipe & Supply Company, Inc

The City does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases, if any, that will be made during the agreement period.

N/A

Delivery:

Annual Price Adjustment:

Notes:

Stock to 30 Days

5%

$576,820.14
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: (All costs must be included or 

your bid will be disqualified)
$559,767.69



8
Meter Yoke (7” rise) 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

B24118)
1200 $125.41 $150,492.00 A.Y McDonald 5156-493 $129.68 $155,616.00 Mueller- 234B24118---N

9
Meter Yoke (12” rise) 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

B24118) 
300 $129.61 $38,883.00 A.Y McDonald 5156-399 $133.00 $39,900.00 Mueller- 238B24118---N

10
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8“X 3/4” X 

3/4“(Mueller H14200) 
100 $17.03 $1,703.00 A.Y McDonald 5120-155 $34.76 $3,476.00 Mueller-014200 215N

11
Angle Meter Curb Stop 5/8” X 3/4” X 3/4” 

(Mueller B24255)
600 $72.90 $43,740.00 A.Y McDonald 5133-134 $75.00 $45,000.00 Mueller- 024255 215N

12
Corporation Stop 3/4" X 3/4“ (Mueller 

H15000) 
350 $30.64 $10,724.00 A.Y McDonald 5112.128 $31.00 $10,850.00 Mueller- 024255 215N

13
Corporation Stop 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller 

H15000) 
150 $32.16 $4,824.00 A.Y McDonald 5111-119 $31.00 $4,650.00 Mueller- 015000 203N

14
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” (Mueller 

H15068) 90 Degree
400 $20.35 $8,140.00 A.Y McDonald 5120-148 $21.55 $8,620.00 Mueller- 015000 203N

15
Two Branch Connection 3/4" X 1” (Mueller 

H15340) 
10 $36.46 $364.60 A.Y McDonald 5127-081 $39.60 $396.00 Mueller- 015340 254N

16
Three Part Union 3/4” (Mueller H-15400)

250 $17.00 $4,250.00 A.Y McDonald 5120-144 $16.93 $4,232.50 Mueller -0154000 250N

17 Straight Coupling 3/4” (Mueller H15425) 50 $13.40 $670.00 A.Y McDonald 5120-139 $13.75 $687.50 Mueller- 015400 250N

18
Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8” x 3/4” (Mueller 

H15490)
125 $21.35 $2,668.75 A.Y McDonald 5120-149 $22.00 $2,750.00 Mueller- 015490 203N

19
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” x 3/4” (Mueller 

H15490)
40 $20.00 $800.00 A.Y McDonald 5120-150 $21.55 $862.00 Mueller- 015490 250N

20
Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” (Mueller 

H15530)
125 $14.30 $1,787.50 A.Y McDonald 5120-154 $13.72 $1,715.00 Mueller- 015530 250N

21
Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-Deg. 3/4" (BMI)

1900 $7.96 $15,124.00 BMI 37005 $6.50 $12,350.00 Merit Brass- IBRLFS9F

22
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 2” 

(McDonald 4620)
35 $9.79 $342.65 A.Y McDonald 5124-080 $10.60 $371.00 Mueller- 10890-12N

23
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 2-1/2” 

(McDonald 4620
30 $9.79 $293.70 A.Y McDonald 5124-110 $10.60 $318.00 Mueller- 10890-N

24
STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4” X 1-1/2” 

(McDonald 4620H)
30 $11.09 $332.70 A.Y McDonald 5124-183 $12.05 $361.50 Mueller- 10890-18N

25
Meter Angle Ball Supply Stop Valve

Lead Fre 3/4“(McDonald 74604B) 
25 $68.29 $1,707.25 A.Y McDonald 5133.137 $68.77 $1,719.25 Mueller- 024265 NF

Item # FITTINGS 1"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

26 Service Coupling 1” (Ford C44-44) 40 $21.35 $854.00 A.Y McDonald 5141-134 $21.00 $840.00 Mueller-P15403 330N

27 Corporation Stop 1“ (Mueller H9971) 40 $43.32 $1,732.80 A.Y McDonald 5113-100 $44.00 $1,760.00 Mueller- 009971 330N

28 Brass Corporation Plug 1” (Mueller H10033) 3 $11.40 $34.20 A.Y McDonald 5126-103 $12.19 $36.57 Mueller- 010033 330N

29 Curb Stop 1" Full Port (Mueller B20283-3) 35 $80.22 $2,807.70 A.Y McDonald 5131-199 $83.22 $2,912.70 Mueller- 020283 330N

30
Service Clamp 2” X 1” (Mueller 

DE2A0235CC100) 
10 $27.79 $277.90 Smith Blair 313-00025609-000 $18.01 $180.10

Mueller 

DR2A0235CC100

31 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H10892) 40 $20.92 $836.80 A.Y McDonald 5124-114 $21.20 $848.00 Mueller- 010892 330N

32 Meter Yoke (12” Rise) 1” (Mueller B24118) 35 $228.88 $8,010.80 A.Y McDonald 5153-077 $245.10 $8,578.50 Mueller-390B24118---N

33 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H14200) 15 $30.74 $461.10 A.Y McDonald 5121-189 $33.20 $498.00 Mueller-014200 330N

34 Angle Meter Curb Stop 1” (Mueller B24255) 115 $109.32 $12,571.80 A.Y McDonald 5133-128 $115.65 $13,299.75 Mueller-024255 330N

35 Three Part Union 1” (Mueller H15400) 40 $29.74 $1,189.60 A.Y McDonald 5121-147 $29.95 $1,198.00 Mueller- 015400 330N

36 Straight Coupling 1” X 3/4” (Mueller H15425) 10 $20.82 $208.20 A.Y McDonald 5121-194 $20.95 $209.50 Mueller- 015425 330N

37 Straight Coupling 1” X 1” (Mueller H15425) 7 $19.55 $136.85 A.Y McDonald 5121-140 $19.05 $133.35 Mueller-015425 333N



38 Straight Coupling 1” X 1” (Mueller H15450) 13 $20.64 $268.32 A.Y McDonald 5121-143 $20.16 $262.08 Mueller-015425 330N

39
Straight Corp. Stop Coupling 1” (Mueller 

H15480)
5 $30.04 $150.20 A.Y McDonald 5121-126 $26.00 $130.00 Mueller-015450 330N

40 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H15490) 25 $33.64 $841.00 A.Y McDonald 5121-155 $34.05 $851.25 Mueller -015490 330N

41 Quarter Bend Coupling 1” (Mueller H15530) 25 $24.09 $602.25 A.Y McDonald 5121-160 $22.71 $567.75 Mueller - 015530 330N

42 Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-DEG 1" (BMI) 50 $13.13 $656.50 BMI 06376 $10.65 $532.50 Merit - IBRLFS9G

43
Meter Angle Ball Supply Stop Valve 1” 

(McDonald 74604B)
25 $103.15 $2,578.75 A.Y McDonald 5133-131 $106.00 $2,650.00 Mueller- 024265 330N

Item # FITTINGS 1 1/2"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

44 Coupling w/Stop C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #600) 1 $5.11 $5.11 BMI 37008 $6.23 $6.23 Nibo - CCJ

45
Female Adaptor C to F.S.P.S. 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#603) 
1 $13.96 $13.96 BMI 37708 $21.05 $21.05 Nibco-CFFAJ

46
Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#604)
1 $12.15 $12.15 BMI 37808 $13.47 $13.47 Nibco- CMAJ

47 Elbow 45-Degree C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #606) 1 $7.85 $7.85 BMI 37208 $12.34 $12.34 Nibco- C4J

48 Elbow 90-Degree C to C 1-1/2” (Nibco #607) 2 $8.84 $17.68 BMI 37308 $11.34 $22.68 Nibco-C9J

49
Elbow 90-Degree Street 1-1/2” (Nibco #607-

2)
1 $9.23 $9.23 BMI 37358 $14.53 $14.53 NibcoCS9J

50
Elbow 90-Degree C to F.S.P.S 1- 1/2” (Nibco 

#707-3) 
1 $9.23 $9.23 Nibco #707-3 $55.37 $55.37 Nibco-CCF9J

51
Elbow 90-Degree C to M.S.P.S 1-1/2” (Nibco 

#707-4) 
1 $9.23 $9.23 Nibco #707-4 $59.12 $59.12 Nibco- CCM9J

52 Service Coupling 1-1/2” (Ford C44-66) 20 $69.09 $1,381.80 A.Y McDonald 5141-170 $71.23 $1,424.60 Mueller- P15403 500N

53 Corporation Stop 1-1/2” (Mueller H10003) 15 $129.53 $1,942.95 A.Y McDonald 5140-014 $129.27 $1,939.05 Mueller - 020003 500N

54
Brass Corporation Plug 1-1/2" (Mueller 

H10033)
2 $35.44 $70.88 A.Y McDonald 5126-105 $24.04 $48.08 Mueller - 010033 500N

55
Quarter Bend Coupling 1-1/2" (Mueller 

H10096) 
16 $58.61 $937.76 A.Y McDonald 5123-102 $81.62 $1,305.92 Mueller - 010096 500N

56
Service Clamp 4” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A0500CC150) 
2 $45.77 $91.54 Smith Blair 313-00048013-00 $39.59 $79.18

Mueller - 

DR2A0447CC150

57
Service Clamp 6” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A0659CC150)
7 $51.44 $360.08 Smith Blair 313-00101013-000 $37.86 $265.02

Mueller - 

DR2A0659CC50

58
Service Clamp 8” X 1-1/2”(Mueller 

DR2A0854CC150)
5 $64.09 $320.45 Smith Blair 313-00101013-000 $42.39 $211.95

Mueller - 

DR2A0854CC150

59
Service Clamp 10” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A1064CC150) 
1 $84.22 $84.22 Smith Blair 313-00121212-000 $55.91 $55.91

Mueller - 

DRA1064CC150

60
Service Clamp 12” X 1-1/2” (Mueller 

DR2A1262CC150)
3 $98.79 $296.37 Smith Blair 313-00143212-000 $65.70 $197.10

Mueller- 

DR2A1262CC150

61
Service Clamp 16" X 1-1/2" (Mueller

DR2A1740CC150) 
1 $117.30 $117.30 Smith Blair 313-00188812-000 $111.53 $111.53

Mueller- 

DR2A1740CC150

62 Brass Coupling (Collar) 1-1/2” (Ford C4466) 4 $69.09 $276.36 A.Y McDonald 5141-170 $70.00 $280.00 Mueller-P15403 500N

63
Bronze Meter Flange, Female 1-1/2” (Ford 

#6) 
2 $43.24 $86.48 A.Y McDonald 5133-124 $50.00 $100.00 Mueller - 10129-M

64 angle Meter Curb Stop 1” (Mueller B24255) 1 $45.63 $45.63 A.Y McDonald 5133-246 $50.00 $50.00 Mueller - 10129-F

Item # FITTINGS 2"

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

65 Nipple, Brass 2” X 1-1/2” CL NL 100 $13.04 $1,304.00 BMI 04900 $11.95 $1,195.00 Merit -GBRNKCL



66 Nipple, Brass 2” X 8” NL 100 $49.34 $4,934.00 BMI 04990 $35.98 $3,598.00 Merit- BRNKX

67 Nipple, Brass 2” X 10” NL 100 $61.28 $6,128.00 BMI 04992 $44.56 $4,456.00 Merit- GBRNK10

68 Coupling with Stop C to C 2” (Nibco #600) 2 $9.27 $18.54 BMI 37009 $10.39 $20.78 Nibco- CCK

69 Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 2” (Nibco #604) 1 $18.43 $18.43 BMI 37809 $22.80 $22.80 Nibco-CMAK

70 Elbow, 45-Degree C to C 2” (Nibco #606) 1 $14.20 $14.20 BMI 37209 $19.17 $19.17 Nibco-C4K

71 Elbow, Brass 90-Degree. No lead. 100 $30.43 $3,043.00 BMI 06309 $24.77 $2,477.00 Merit- IBRLF9K

72 Elbow, 90-Degree C to C 2” (Nibco #607) 7 $16.10 $112.70 BMI 37309 $20.66 $144.62 Nibco-C9K

73
Elbow, 90-Degree C to M.S.P.S. 2” (Nibco 

#707-4) 
1 $32.58 $32.58 Nibco #707-4 $96.55 $96.55 Nibco-CCM9K

74 Service Coupling 2” (Ford #C44-77) 9 $92.95 $836.55 A.Y McDonald 5141-183 $97.50 $877.50 Mueller- P15403 500N

75 Corporation Stop 2” (Mueller H10003) 30 $219.45 $6,583.50 A.Y McDonald 5140-016 $235.00 $7,050.00 Mueller- 020003 500N

76 Brass Corporation Plug 2" (Mueller H10033) 2 $45.66 $91.32 A.Y McDonald 5126-106 $54.72 $109.44 Mueller- 0110034 550N

77 Brass Corporation Plug 2" (Mueller H10035) 2 $45.66 $91.32 A.Y McDonald 5126-112 $44.00 $88.00 Mueller- 010035 550N

78
Brass Sq. HD Core Plug 2” NL

100 $14.07 $1,407.00 BMI 06609 $11.77 $1,177.00 Mueller- IBRLFCPLUGK

79 Quarter Bend Coupling 2” (Mueller H10096) 15 $86.29 $1,294.35 A.Y McDonald 5123-103 $86.10 $1,291.50 Mueller- 010096 550N

80
Service Clamp 4” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0500CC200) 
1 $45.77 $45.77 Smith Blair 313-00048015-00 $38.00 $38.00 Mueller- DR2A0447CCK

81
Service Clamp 6” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0659CC200) 
5 $51.44 $257.20 Smith Blair 313-00069015-000 $40.00 $200.00

Mueller- 

DR2A0659CC200

82
Service Clamp 8” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A0905CC200) 
5 $64.09 $320.45 Smith Blair 313-00101015-000 $45.00 $225.00

Mueller - 

DR2A0854CC200

83
Service Clamp 10” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1064CC200)
1 $84.22 $84.22 Smith Blair 313-00121215-000 $57.00 $57.00

Mueller - 

DR2A1064CC200

84
Service Clamp 12” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1262CC200) 
6 $98.79 $592.74 Smith Blair 313-00143215-000 $68.25 $409.50

Mueller - 

DR2A1262CC200

85
Service Clamp 16” X 2” (Mueller 

DR2A1740CC200)
2 $177.30 $354.60 Smith Blair 313-00188815-000 $117.00 $234.00

Mueller -

DR2A1740CC200

86 Brass Coupling (Collar) 2" (Ford 400352) 20 $195.16 $3,903.20 A.Y McDonald 74758-44 $95.25 $1,905.00 Ford 400352

87 Brass Reducer 2-1/2" X 2" (Bell Reducer) 20 $50.98 $1,019.60 BMI 06046 $47.10 $942.00 Merit- IBRLFRCLK

88 Brass Bushing 2” X 1-1/2” NL 100 $15.92 $1,592.00 BMI 06140 $13.85 $1,385.00 Merit- IBRLFBKJ

89 Brass Bushing 3” X 2” 100 $46.43 $4,643.00 BMI 06152 $139.25 $13,925.00 Merit- BRLFBMK

90 Brass Reducer 3” X 2” 100 $85.58 $8,558.00 BMI 06052 $59.60 $5,960.00 Merit- IBRLFRCMK

91 Bronze Meter Flange Female 2” (Ford #7) 6 $56.15 $336.90 A.Y McDonald 5133-125 $60.00 $360.00 Mueller - 10129-F

92 Bronze Meter Flange Male 2” (Ford #7M) 1 $63.86 $63.86 A.Y McDonald 5133-248 $60.00 $60.00 Mueller - 10129-M

Item # Fittings, ProPress Compression

Est. 

Yearly

Qty

Unit Cost Extended Cost
Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

93
90-Degree Street Bend C to M 1- 1/2” X 1-

1/2” (Only Viega #77522) 
20 $35.41 $708.20 Viega 77037 $41.41 $828.20 Viega- 77522

94
90-Degree Street Bend C to M 2” X 2” (Only 

Viega #77527) 
40 $49.31 $1,972.40 Viega 77042 $62.68 $2,507.20 Viega- 77527

95
45-Degree Bend C to C 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77627) 
20 $30.44 $608.80 Viega 77038 $30.05 $601.00 Viega- 77038



96
45-Degree Bend C to C 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77632) 
30 $41.83 $1,254.90 Viega 77043 $41.66 $1,249.80 Viega- 77043

97
90-Degree Bend C to C 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#77377)
50 $35.41 $1,770.50 Viega 77037 $35.12 $1,756.00 Viega- 77037

98
90-Degree Bend C to C 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77342) 
60 $49.34 $2,960.40 Viega 77042 $49.30 $2,958.00 Viega- 77042

99
90-Degree Bend C to F 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77562)
10 $37.41 $374.10 Viega 77067 $60.15 $601.50 Viega- 79565

100
90-Degree Bend C to F 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77567) 
5 $51.58 $257.90 Viega 77072 $95.45 $477.25 Viega- 79570

101 TEE C X C X C 1-1/2” (Only Viega #77457) 1 $45.96 $45.96 Viega 77457 $45.88 $45.88 Viega- 77457

102 TEE C X C X C 2” (Only Viega #77477) 1 $56.54 $56.54 Viega 77477 $56.67 $56.67 Viega- 77477

103
Reducer C X C 2” X 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#78167)
10 $34.70 $347.00 Viega 78167 $34.40 $344.00 Viega- 78167

104
Male Adaptor C X M 1-1/2” X 1-1/2” (Only 

Viega #77872)
30 $33.58 $1,007.40 Viega 79275 $33.25 $997.50 Viega- 79275

105
Male Adaptor C X M 2” X 2” (Only Viega 

#77877)
75 $64.69 $4,851.75 Viega 79230 $63.97 $4,797.75 Viega- 79290

106
Coupling C X C w/o Stop 1-1/2” (Only Viega 

#78192) 
50 $25.48 $1,274.00 Viega 78192 $62.45 $3,122.50 Viega- 78192

107
Coupling C X C w/o Stop 2” (Only Viega 

#78197)
100 $28.95 $2,895.00 Viega 78197 $28.52 $2,852.00 Viega- 78197

Item # Fittings, Tectite Push-Fit
Est. Yearly

Qty
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name and Part 

Number
Unit Cost Extended Cost

Manufacturer Name 

and Part Number

108
BRS Coupling w/st C X C 3/4” (Only Tectite 

200) 
200 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.10 $3,020.00 Tectite- 10155455

109
BRS Female Adaptor C X F 3/4” (Only 

Tectite 203) 
300 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.84 $2,652.00 Tectite- 1015549634

110
BRS Male Adaptor C X M 3/4” (Only Tectite 

204) 
450 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.88 $3,996.00 Tectite- 10155470

111
BRS 90-Degree Bend C X C 3/4” (Only 

Tectite 207) 
375 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.39 $4,646.25 Tectite- 10155478

112 BRS Tee C X C X C 3/4" (Only Tectite 211) 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.82 $672.80 Tectite- 10155488

113
BRS Coupling w/st C X C 1” (Only Tectite 

200) 
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.27 $1,313.50 Tectite- 10155456

114
BRS Female Adaptor C X F 1” (Only Tectite 

203) 
45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 $990.00 Tectite- 10155472

115
BRS Male Adaptor C X M 1” (Only Tectite 

204) 
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.21 $1,060.50 Tectite- 10155472

116
BRS 90 Degree Bend C X C1” (Only Tectite 

207) 
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.29 $1,757.40 Tectite- 10155482

117 BRS Tee C X C X C 1” (Only Tectite 211 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.90 $199.50 Tectite- 10155496

The City does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases, if any, that will be made during the agreement period.

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: (All costs must be included or 

your bid will be disqualified)

Delivery:

Annual Price Adjustment:

Notes:

$559,924.54

Stock - 6 weeks

8%

N/A

14-21 Days

6%

N/A

$525,724.31


