
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 745D James Mozingo, Buyer
175 E. 2nd Street #575 Police Equipment & Various Uniform jmozingo@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 741023 Police Department Please contact if you have any questions

2. Pricing
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INDIVIDUAL 
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EXTENDED 
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1 Safariland High Gloss Buckless Duty Belt w/ Hook Velcro on the 
internal side, No Substitutions 94-30-09 90 $63.60 $5,724.00 $1.10 $99.00 No Bid No Bid $58.35 $5,251.50 No Bid No Bid

2 Safariland Countoured High Gloss Buckless Duty Belt w/ Hook 
Velcro on the internal side, No Substitutions 942-38-50 10 $63.43 $634.30 $1.13 $11.30 No Bid No Bid $60.41 $604.10 No Bid No Bid

3 Safariland Buckless Trouser Belt w/ Loop Velcro on the exterior, 
No Substitutions 99-3-01 100 $31.62 $3,162.00 $31.50 $3,150.00 No Bid No Bid $19.64 $1,964.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Safariland High Gloss Covered Cuff Case with Hidden Snap 
Closure to fit Chained or Hinged Cuffs, No Substitutions 190-2-49 100 $30.32 $3,032.00 $18.50 $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid $27.85 $2,785.00 No Bid No Bid

5 Safariland High Gloss Covered Double Mag Pouch with Hidden 
Snap Closure, No Substitutions 77-083-4HS 100 $33.28 $3,328.00 $1.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $30.55 $3,055.00 No Bid No Bid

6 Safariland Single High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Keeper, No 
Substitutions 62HS 20 $8.09 $161.80 $8.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid $8.10 $162.00 No Bid No Bid

7 Safariland Four Pack of High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure 
Keepes, No Substitutions 62HS 4 Pack 100 $30.88 $3,088.00 $18.25 $1,825.00 No Bid No Bid $17.96 $1,796.00 No Bid No Bid

8 Safariland High Gloss Flashlight Ring w/ Black Snaps, No 
Substitutions 730 100 $8.28 $828.00 $8.25 $825.00 No Bid No Bid $8.63 $863.00 No Bid No Bid

9 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Mace Pouch to fit 
MKIII Size Cannisters, No Substitutions 38 100 $25.74 $2,574.00 $1.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $24.50 $2,450.00 No Bid No Bid

10 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Velcro Closure Surgical Glove 
Pouch, No Substitutions 33 100 $16.00 $1,600.00 $14.25 $1,425.00 No Bid No Bid $15.23 $1,523.00 No Bid No Bid

11 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Covered Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 308 10 $26.47 $264.70 $17.00 $170.00 No Bid No Bid $24.30 $243.00 No Bid No Bid

12 Safariland High Gloss Open Top Flashlight Holder, No 
Substitutions 306 100 $21.88 $2,188.00 $22.00 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid $20.08 $2,008.00 No Bid No Bid

13 Safariland High Gloss Colapsable Baton Holder, No 
Substitutions 135 10 $25.74 $257.40 $1.11 $11.10 No Bid No Bid $23.62 $236.20 No Bid No Bid

14 Bianchi Accumold Duty Belt with Loop Velcro on the interior, No 
Substitutions 7200 150 $47.41 $7,111.50 $29.00 $4,350.00 No Bid No Bid $37.72 $5,658.00 No Bid No Bid

15 Bianchi Accumold Trouser Belt with Hook Velcro on the exterior, 
No Substitutions 7205 150 $26.29 $3,943.50 $29.00 $4,350.00 No Bid No Bid $20.55 $3,082.50 No Bid No Bid

16 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Covered Cuff Case to fit 
Chained or Hinged Cuffs 7300 150 $24.57 $3,685.50 $16.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid $16.37 $2,455.50 No Bid No Bid

17 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Covered Double Mag Pouch, No 
Substitutions 7302 150 $30.83 $4,624.50 $1.12 $168.00 No Bid No Bid $23.70 $3,555.00 No Bid No Bid

18 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Pouch to fit MKIII Size 
Cannisters, No Substitutions 7307 150 $19.19 $2,878.50 $14.65 $2,197.50 No Bid No Bid $14.86 $2,229.00 No Bid No Bid

19 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Covered Mini Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 7310 150 $17.24 $2,586.00 $13.15 $1,972.50 No Bid No Bid $13.93 $2,089.50 No Bid No Bid

20 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Covered Small Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 7311 150 $23.71 $3,556.50 $18.00 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid $18.06 $2,709.00 No Bid No Bid

21 Bianchi Accumold Colapsable Baton Holder, No Substitutions 7312 10 $16.38 $163.80 $12.50 $125.00 No Bid No Bid $12.82 $128.20 No Bid No Bid

22 Bianchi Accumold Radio Holder, No Substitutions 7314 150 $28.24 $4,236.00 $21.50 $3,225.00 No Bid No Bid $22.93 $3,439.50 No Bid No Bid
23 Bianchi Accumold Swivel Radio Holder, No Substitutions 7314S 10 $33.62 $336.20 $25.50 $255.00 No Bid No Bid $26.32 $263.20 No Bid No Bid
24 Bianchi Accumold Flat Glove Pouch, No Substitutions 7328 150 $16.38 $2,457.00 $12.50 $1,875.00 No Bid No Bid $13.30 $1,995.00 No Bid No Bid

25 Bianchi Accumold Four Pack of Keepers, No Substitutions 7406 150 $11.86 $1,779.00 $0.99 $148.50 No Bid No Bid $10.33 $1,549.50 No Bid No Bid

26 511 Sierra Bravo Duty Belt Kit, No Substitutions 59505 10 $49.99 $499.90 $39.75 $397.50 No Bid No Bid $46.92 $469.20 No Bid No Bid
27 511 Ranger Shoes 12308 100 $71.88 $7,188.00 $71.75 $7,175.00 No Bid No Bid $77.62 $7,762.00 No Bid No Bid

1. Delivery:  If your bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you 
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28 511 Men's ABR Trainer 16004 100 $81.25 $8,125.00 $81.10 $8,110.00 No Bid No Bid $86.00 $8,600.00 No Bid No Bid
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29 511 Women's ABR Trainer 16005 25 $86.33 $2,158.25 $81.10 $2,027.50 No Bid No Bid $86.00 $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid
30 511 Skyweight Coyote Boot 12320 25 $114.88 $2,872.00 $108.00 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid $113.50 $2,837.50 No Bid No Bid
31 511 Skyweight Waterproof Side Zip Boot 12321 50 $122.85 $6,142.50 $92.00 $4,600.00 No Bid No Bid $120.25 $6,012.50 No Bid No Bid
32 Under Armor Mirage 3.0 1287351 100 $68.91 $6,891.00 $68.00 $6,800.00 No Bid No Bid $65.45 $6,545.00 No Bid No Bid
33 Under Armor Valsetz Boot 1250234 100 $97.28 $9,728.00 $96.00 $9,600.00 No Bid No Bid $89.00 $8,900.00 No Bid No Bid
34 Bates GX-8 Side Zip w/ Goretex E02268 50 $142.50 $7,125.00 $97.00 $4,850.00 No Bid No Bid $89.77 $4,488.50 $85.25 $4,262.50
35 Bates 8" Tactical Sport Side Zip E02261 50 $97.08 $4,854.00 $85.00 $4,250.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 $3,500.00 $74.75 $3,737.50
36 Bates 5" Tactical Sport Boot E02262 50 $86.67 $4,333.50 $76.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid $71.40 $3,570.00 $66.75 $3,337.50
37 Thorogood High Gloss Academy Shoe 831-6031 100 $63.64 $6,364.00 $55.50 $5,550.00 No Bid No Bid $28.21 $2,821.00 $46.00 $4,600.00
38 Bates Men's Durashock High Gloss Oxford E00111 20 $123.75 $2,475.00 $109.00 $2,180.00 No Bid No Bid $44.80 $896.00 $95.25 $1,905.00
39 Bates Women's Durashock High Gloss Oxford E00742 5 $123.75 $618.75 $109.00 $545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.25 $476.25
40 Bates 2 Pack of Socks E11917170 100 $11.67 $1,167.00 $10.50 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 $900.00

41 Safariland Level III SSIII Mid Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 070-83-91/92 20 $156.60 $3,132.00 $2.22 $44.40 No Bid No Bid $156.00 $3,120.00 No Bid No Bid

42 Safariland Level III SSIII Low Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 0705-83-91/92 20 $156.60 $3,132.00 $120.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid $152.00 $3,040.00 No Bid No Bid

43 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 6360-83-91/92 20 $168.33 $3,366.60 $163.00 $3,260.00 No Bid No Bid $155.93 $3,118.60 No Bid No Bid

44 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 6365-83-91/92 20 $154.31 $3,086.20 $163.00 $3,260.00 No Bid No Bid $155.93 $3,118.60 No Bid No Bid

45 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster, No Substitutions 6360-83-131/132 20 $168.33 $3,366.60 $2.22 $44.40 No Bid No Bid $114.66 $2,293.20 No Bid No Bid

46 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster, No Substitutions 6365-83-131/132 20 $154.31 $3,086.20 $2.21 $44.20 No Bid No Bid $114.66 $2,293.20 No Bid No Bid

47 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride High Gloss Holster to Fit 
Gun Light, No Substitutions 6360-832-91/92 20 $168.33 $3,366.60 $174.50 $3,490.00 No Bid No Bid $159.96 $3,199.20 No Bid No Bid

48 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride High Gloss Holster to Fit 
Gun Light, No Substitutions 6365-832-91/92 10 $154.31 $1,543.10 $1,745.50 $17,455.00 No Bid No Bid $159.96 $1,599.60 No Bid No Bid

49 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 6360-832-131/132 10 $168.33 $1,683.30 $131.00 $1,310.00 No Bid No Bid $126.36 $1,263.60 No Bid No Bid

50 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 6365-832-131/132 20 $154.31 $3,086.20 $131.00 $2,620.00 No Bid No Bid $126.36 $2,527.20 No Bid No Bid

51 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride Plain Finish Holster, 
No Substitutions 7360-83-411/412 100 $122.50 $12,250.00 $0.98 $98.00 No Bid No Bid $118.20 $11,820.00 No Bid No Bid

52 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride Plain Finish Holster, 
No Substitutions 7365-83-411/412 25 $112.29 $2,807.25 $105.50 $2,637.50 No Bid No Bid $118.20 $2,955.00 No Bid No Bid

53 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride Plain Finish Holster 
to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 7360-832-411/412 50 $122.50 $6,125.00 $123.25 $6,162.50 No Bid No Bid $127.20 $6,360.00 No Bid No Bid

54 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride Plain Finish Holster 
to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 7365-832-411/412 25 $112.29 $2,807.25 $123.75 $3,093.75 No Bid No Bid $127.20 $3,180.00 No Bid No Bid

55 Safariland 6385 ALS OMV Tactical Holster Available in multiple 
colors, No Substitutions

6385-832-131/132-
SP10 15 $186.48 $2,797.20 $1.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $159.75 $2,396.25 No Bid No Bid

56 Safariland 7TS ALS Tactical Holster Available in multiple colors, 
No Substitutions

7385-832-131/132-
SP10 10 $173.98 $1,739.80 $130.00 $1,300.00 No Bid No Bid $151.65 $1,516.50 No Bid No Bid

57 Flying Cross 100% Wool Uniform Men's Trousers, price to 
include hemming, No Substitutions 32289 100 $96.97 $9,697.00 $87.00 $8,700.00 No Bid No Bid $77.92 $7,792.00 No Bid No Bid

58 Flying Cross 100% Wool Uniform Women's Trousers price to 
include hemming, No Substitutions 32289W 25 $96.97 $2,424.25 $81.00 $2,025.00 No Bid No Bid $77.92 $1,948.00 No Bid No Bid

59 Flying Cross 100% Wool Men's Short Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 70R95 100 $64.50 $6,450.00 $81.00 $8,100.00 No Bid No Bid $65.89 $6,589.00 No Bid No Bid

60 Flying Cross 100% Wool Women's Short Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 170R95 25 $64.50 $1,612.50 $75.00 $1,875.00 No Bid No Bid $65.89 $1,647.25 No Bid No Bid

61 Flying Cross 100% Wool Men's Long Sleeve Shirt w/ Department 
Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 20W95 100 $75.60 $7,560.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid $81.00 $8,100.00 No Bid No Bid

62 Flying Cross 100% Wool Women's Long Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 120W95 25 $75.60 $1,890.00 $88.00 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid $81.00 $2,025.00 No Bid No Bid

63 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Uniform Men's Trousers 
price to include hemming, No Substitutions 47280 100 $90.24 $9,024.00 $73.00 $7,300.00 No Bid No Bid $68.00 $6,800.00 No Bid No Bid

64 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Uniform Women's 
Trousers price to include hemming, No Substitutions 47280W 25 $90.24 $2,256.00 $69.00 $1,725.00 No Bid No Bid $68.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid
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65
Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Men's Short Sleeve Shirt 
w/ Zippers and w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No 
Substitutions

57R84Z 100 $74.42 $7,442.00 $62.00 $6,200.00 No Bid No Bid $61.25 $6,125.00 No Bid No Bid
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EXTENDED 
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EXTENDED 
COST

66 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Women's Short Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 157R84 25 $69.98 $1,749.50 $54.50 $1,362.50 No Bid No Bid $61.25 $1,531.25 No Bid No Bid

67
Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Men's Long Sleeve Shirt 
with Zippers  and w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No 
Substitutions

07W84Z 100 $80.98 $8,098.00 $69.00 $6,900.00 No Bid No Bid $63.77 $6,377.00 No Bid No Bid

68 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Women's Long Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 107W84 25 $77.48 $1,937.00 $61.50 $1,537.50 No Bid No Bid $63.77 $1,594.25 No Bid No Bid

69 Vertx Phantom LT 2.0 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Pant, 
hemmed, No Substitutions VTX8001 200 $45.19 $9,038.00 $42.50 $8,500.00 No Bid No Bid $43.20 $8,640.00 No Bid No Bid

70 Vertx Phantom LT 2.0 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Women's 
Pant, hemmed, No Substitutions VTX8051 50 $45.19 $2,259.50 $42.50 $2,125.00 No Bid No Bid $43.20 $2,160.00 No Bid No Bid

71
Vertx Phantom LT 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Short Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeve and Badge Tab, No 
Substitutions

VTX8100 250 $59.99 $14,997.50 $45.00 $11,250.00 No Bid No Bid $50.25 $12,562.50 No Bid No Bid

72
Vertx Phantom LT 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Long Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeve and Badge Tab, No 
Substitutions

VTX8120 75 $69.99 $5,249.25 $49.00 $3,675.00 No Bid No Bid $54.25 $4,068.75 No Bid No Bid

73 511 Apex Pants, No Substitutions 74434 400 $59.99 $23,996.00 $64.00 $25,600.00 No Bid No Bid $63.70 $25,480.00 No Bid No Bid

74
Spiewak windproof, Water proof Soft Shell Jacket w/ Department 
Patches on both Sleeves, Department Badge Patch Left Chest, 
and Custom Name Tape Left Chest, No Substitutions 

S318Z 100 $131.99 $13,199.00 $108.00 $10,800.00 No Bid No Bid $115.25 $11,525.00 No Bid No Bid

75

Spiewak windproof, Water proof Soft Shell Jacket with chest and 
sleeve pockets, Department Patches on both Sleeves, 
Department Badge Patch Left Chest, and Custom Name Tape 
Left Chest, No Substitutions 

S318ZX 50 $145.99 $7,299.50 $122.00 $6,100.00 No Bid No Bid $221.50 $11,075.00 No Bid No Bid

76 Keystone Uniform Dress Cap with two Horizontal Eyelets, No 
Substitutions R10 100 $99.99 $9,999.00 $55.00 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid $56.00 $5,600.00 No Bid No Bid

77 Samuel Broome Clip on Navy Tie in Regular and Long Lengths 450 125 $6.88 $860.00 $2.50 $312.50 No Bid No Bid $4.85 $606.25 No Bid No Bid

78 Spiewak ANSI 2 Traffic Vest w/ Custom Black Lettering, TULSA 
POLICE Vertically added to the front and back S912 100 $59.32 $5,932.00 $53.50 $5,350.00 No Bid No Bid $38.50 $3,850.00 No Bid No Bid

79 Richarson Flex Fit Dark Navy Hat w/ Department Logo 
Embroidered on the front, No Substitutions 500S5 200 $19.99 $3,998.00 $11.00 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid $14.80 $2,960.00 No Bid No Bid

80 Adding Badge Number or Last Name to the back of the Ballcap Optional Hat 
Embroidery 150 $8.00 $1,200.00 $2.50 $375.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid

81 Port Authority Watch Cap, No Substitutions CP90 150 $8.99 $1,348.50 $4.99 $748.50 No Bid No Bid $2.97 $445.50 No Bid No Bid
82 Stratton Navy Straw Campaign Hat S-40DB 25 $98.87 $2,471.75 $65.00 $1,625.00 No Bid No Bid $86.35 $2,158.75 No Bid No Bid
83 Black Name Plate with White Lettering Name Plate 100 $13.90 $1,390.00 $7.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84 Smith & Warren Gol-Ray Tulsa PD Badge w/ a Custom Seal, 
Lifetime Warranty, and free refinishing, No Substitutions S42A Gol-Ray 100 $159.00 $15,900.00 $75.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

85 Monadnock X2 26" Baton Kit that includes 26" Autolock Baton, 
Wedge Cap, and Baton Holder, No Substitutions 9875 100 $155.63 $15,563.00 $5.21 $521.00 No Bid No Bid $129.48 $12,948.00 No Bid No Bid

86 Monadnock Riot Helmet with Ear Covers, Face Shield, and 
Flexible Chin Cup, No Substitutions TR1000 100 $133.33 $13,333.00 $107.00 $10,700.00 No Bid No Bid $133.45 $13,345.00 No Bid No Bid

87 Monadnock 36" Wooden Baton, No Substitutions 2800 25 $25.99 $649.75 $21.75 $543.75 No Bid No Bid $22.68 $567.00 No Bid No Bid
88 Metal Radio Clip to fit XTS5000 M-X5000 100 $35.99 $3,599.00 $29.00 $2,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 Saunders Form Holder, No Substitutions 12201 100 $25.57 $2,557.00 $22.00 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid $19.72 $1,972.00 No Bid No Bid
90 Saunders Ticket Book Holder, No Substitutions 10003 100 $20.79 $2,079.00 $17.75 $1,775.00 No Bid No Bid $16.03 $1,603.00 No Bid No Bid
91 Bear Aide Pocket Traffic Template, No Substitutions 6133-34 100 $17.10 $1,710.00 $12.60 $1,260.00 No Bid No Bid $11.97 $1,197.00 No Bid No Bid

92 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 75810 5 $98.29 $491.45 $99.75 $498.75 $90.78 $453.90 $97.01 $485.05 $83.25 $416.25

93 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ AC Charger, No Substitutions 75811 10 $128.58 $1,285.80 $117.00 $1,170.00 $109.50 $1,095.00 $117.01 $1,170.10 $100.50 $1,005.00
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94 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ DC Charger, No Substitutions 75812 10 $115.41 $1,154.10 $113.00 $1,130.00 $103.25 $1,032.48 $110.33 $1,103.30 $94.75 $947.50

95 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ AC & DC Chargers, No 
Substitutions 75813 10 $139.06 $1,390.60 $133.00 $1,330.00 $121.98 $1,219.80 $127.10 $1,271.00 $112.00 $1,120.00

96 Streamlight Stinger DS LED HL w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 75453 10 $122.58 $1,225.80 $114.00 $1,140.00 $104.39 $1,043.88 $111.44 $1,114.40 $95.75 $957.50

97 Streamlight Stinger DS LED HL w/ Two Chargers, No 
Substitutions 75454 10 $164.73 $1,647.30 $154.00 $1,540.00 $140.28 $1,402.80 $144.36 $1,443.60 $128.75 $1,287.50

98 Streamlight TLR1 High Lumen Gun Light, No Substitutions 69260 100 $134.99 $13,499.00 $148.00 $14,800.00 $134.08 $13,408.00 $133.91 $13,391.00 $123.00 $12,300.00

99 Streamlight Strion LED w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 74300 5 $157.45 $787.25 $75.00 $375.00 $71.64 $358.20 $76.07 $380.35 $65.93 $329.65
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EXTENDED 
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100 Streamlight Strion LED w/ One AC/DC Charger, No Substitutions 74301 10 $111.86 $1,118.60 $115.00 $1,150.00 $102.44 $1,024.40 $106.50 $1,065.00 $94.00 $940.00

101 Streamlight Strion LED w/ Two AC/DC Charger, No Substitutions 74302 100 $131.03 $13,103.00 $125.00 $12,500.00 $121.73 $12,173.00 $125.29 $12,529.00 $111.75 $11,175.00

102 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light No Chargers, 
No Substitutions 74610 10 $106.20 $1,062.00 $99.00 $990.00 $90.44 $904.40 $93.00 $930.00 $83.00 $830.00

103 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light One AC/DC 
Charger, No Substitutions 74611 10 $147.86 $1,478.60 $137.00 $1,370.00 $125.92 $1,259.20 $129.58 $1,295.80 $115.50 $1,155.00

104 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light Two AC/DC 
Chargers, No Substitutions 74612 10 $173.88 $1,738.80 $162.00 $1,620.00 $148.08 $1,480.80 $149.86 $1,498.60 $136.00 $1,360.00

105 Avon C50 APR Gas Mask, No Substitutions 70501 10 $1,188.00 $11,880.00 $340.00 $3,400.00 No Bid No Bid $359.88 $3,598.80 No Bid No Bid
106 Avon Clear Outsert Assembly, No Substitutions 70501-156 10 $58.00 $580.00 $52.00 $520.00 No Bid No Bid $47.32 $473.20 No Bid No Bid
107 Avon CBRN Filter, No Substitutions 72602-2 10 $68.00 $680.00 $63.55 $635.50 No Bid No Bid $55.73 $557.30 No Bid No Bid
108 Avon Universal Carrier, No Substitutions 70501-227 10 $38.00 $380.00 $32.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid $30.24 $302.40 No Bid No Bid
109 Avon Storage Faceform, No Substitutions 72601 10 $26.00 $260.00 $18.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $170.00 No Bid No Bid

110 Avon CTCF50 Riot Agent Cannister Four Pack, No Substitutions 72606-3 50 $184.00 $9,200.00 $1.13 $56.50 No Bid No Bid $148.96 $7,448.00 No Bid No Bid

111

Avon C50 First Responder Kit which includes C50 Mask, Clear 
Outsert, Sunlight outsert, CBRN Canister, CTCF50 Riot 
Canister, Universal Carrier, and Storage Faceform, No 
Substitutions

70501-55X 100 $668.00 $66,800.00 $525.00 $52,500.00 No Bid No Bid $515.88 $51,588.00 No Bid No Bid

112 Sabre Red 10%, 1.8oz Cone Spray, No Substitutions 521010-C 250 $10.49 $2,622.50 $12.25 $3,062.50 No Bid No Bid $12.40 $3,100.00 No Bid No Bid
113 Sabre Red Inert 1.6oz Cone Spray, No Substitutions 50H201010-C 100 $8.69 $869.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid $10.65 $1,065.00 No Bid No Bid
114 Sabre Red 10% Stream Spray, No Substitutions 52H2ONY-BK 250 $8.69 $2,172.50 $10.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid $10.44 $2,610.00 No Bid No Bid
115 Smith & Wesson Nickle Chained Handcuffs 100 100 $32.50 $3,250.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid $24.26 $2,426.00 No Bid No Bid
116 Smith & Wesson Nickle Hinged Handcuffs 300 25 $48.25 $1,206.25 $28.65 $716.25 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid
117 Streamlight Lithium Battery 85179-1 500 $2.00 $1,000.00 $1.85 $925.00 $555.70 $4.28 $2,140.00 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL EXTENDED COST $551,768.95

Complete Bid Complete Bid 
$424,177.90 $37,411.56 $454,045.75 $53,042.15
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1 Safariland High Gloss Buckless Duty Belt w/ Hook Velcro on the 
internal side, No Substitutions 94-30-09 90 No Bid No Bid $49.31 $4,437.90 $49.04 $4,413.60 No Bid No Bid $53.50 $4,815.00

2 Safariland Countoured High Gloss Buckless Duty Belt w/ Hook 
Velcro on the internal side, No Substitutions 942-38-50 10 No Bid No Bid $51.02 $510.20 $50.74 $507.40 No Bid No Bid $60.00 $600.00

3 Safariland Buckless Trouser Belt w/ Loop Velcro on the exterior, 
No Substitutions 99-3-01 100 No Bid No Bid $24.51 $2,451.00 $24.38 $2,438.00 No Bid No Bid $29.00 $2,900.00

4 Safariland High Gloss Covered Cuff Case with Hidden Snap 
Closure to fit Chained or Hinged Cuffs, No Substitutions 190-2-49 100 No Bid No Bid $23.52 $2,352.00 $20.98 $2,098.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $2,800.00

5 Safariland High Gloss Covered Double Mag Pouch with Hidden 
Snap Closure, No Substitutions 77-083-4HS 100 No Bid No Bid $25.80 $2,580.00 $25.66 $2,566.00 No Bid No Bid $30.50 $3,050.00

6 Safariland Single High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Keeper, No 
Substitutions 62HS 20 No Bid No Bid $6.27 $125.40 $6.38 $127.60 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $150.00

7 Safariland Four Pack of High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure 
Keepes, No Substitutions 62HS 4 Pack 100 No Bid No Bid $14.25 $1,425.00 $14.17 $1,417.00 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $1,700.00

8 Safariland High Gloss Flashlight Ring w/ Black Snaps, No 
Substitutions 730 100 No Bid No Bid $6.42 $642.00 $6.53 $653.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $750.00

9 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Mace Pouch to fit 
MKIII Size Cannisters, No Substitutions 38 100 No Bid No Bid $19.95 $1,995.00 $19.84 $1,984.00 No Bid No Bid $23.75 $2,375.00

10 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Velcro Closure Surgical Glove 
Pouch, No Substitutions 33 100 No Bid No Bid $12.40 $1,240.00 $12.34 $1,234.00 No Bid No Bid $14.75 $1,475.00

11 Safariland High Gloss Hidden Snap Closure Covered Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 308 10 No Bid No Bid $20.52 $205.20 $17.57 $175.70 No Bid No Bid $24.50 $245.00

12 Safariland High Gloss Open Top Flashlight Holder, No 
Substitutions 306 100 No Bid No Bid $16.96 $1,696.00 $16.87 $1,687.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $2,000.00

13 Safariland High Gloss Colapsable Baton Holder, No 
Substitutions 135 10 No Bid No Bid $19.95 $199.50 $17.57 $175.70 No Bid No Bid $23.75 $237.50

14 Bianchi Accumold Duty Belt with Loop Velcro on the interior, No 
Substitutions 7200 150 No Bid No Bid $22.52 $3,378.00 $22.39 $3,358.50 No Bid No Bid $26.75 $4,012.50

15 Bianchi Accumold Trouser Belt with Hook Velcro on the exterior, 
No Substitutions 7205 150 No Bid No Bid $22.52 $3,378.00 $22.39 $3,358.50 No Bid No Bid $20.75 $3,112.50

16 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Covered Cuff Case to fit 
Chained or Hinged Cuffs 7300 150 No Bid No Bid $16.25 $2,437.50 $13.95 $2,092.50 No Bid No Bid $16.50 $2,475.00

17 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Covered Double Mag Pouch, No 
Substitutions 7302 150 No Bid No Bid $20.38 $3,057.00 $20.27 $3,040.50 No Bid No Bid $24.50 $3,675.00

18 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Pouch to fit MKIII Size 
Cannisters, No Substitutions 7307 150 No Bid No Bid $12.69 $1,903.50 $12.62 $1,893.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $2,250.00

19 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Covered Mini Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 7310 150 No Bid No Bid $11.40 $1,710.00 $11.34 $1,701.00 No Bid No Bid $13.50 $2,025.00

20 Bianchi Accumold Hidden Snap Mace Covered Small Flashlight 
Holder, No Substitutions 7311 150 No Bid No Bid $15.68 $2,352.00 $15.59 $2,338.50 No Bid No Bid $18.50 $2,775.00

21 Bianchi Accumold Colapsable Baton Holder, No Substitutions 7312 10 No Bid No Bid $10.83 $108.30 $11.02 $110.20 No Bid No Bid $13.00 $130.00

22 Bianchi Accumold Radio Holder, No Substitutions 7314 150 No Bid No Bid $18.67 $2,800.50 $18.57 $2,785.50 No Bid No Bid $22.25 $3,337.50
23 Bianchi Accumold Swivel Radio Holder, No Substitutions 7314S 10 No Bid No Bid $22.23 $222.30 $22.11 $221.10 No Bid No Bid $26.50 $265.00
24 Bianchi Accumold Flat Glove Pouch, No Substitutions 7328 150 No Bid No Bid $10.83 $1,624.50 $11.02 $1,653.00 No Bid No Bid $13.00 $1,950.00

25 Bianchi Accumold Four Pack of Keepers, No Substitutions 7406 150 No Bid No Bid $7.34 $1,101.00 $7.98 $1,197.00 No Bid No Bid $9.25 $1,387.50

26 511 Sierra Bravo Duty Belt Kit, No Substitutions 59505 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.60 $316.00 No Bid No Bid $36.75 $367.50
27 511 Ranger Shoes 12308 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.79 $5,679.00 No Bid No Bid $61.50 $6,150.00
28 511 Men's ABR Trainer 16004 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.19 $6,419.00 No Bid No Bid $69.50 $6,950.00
29 511 Women's ABR Trainer 16005 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.19 $1,604.75 No Bid No Bid $69.50 $1,737.50
30 511 Skyweight Coyote Boot 12320 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.43 $2,135.75 No Bid No Bid $92.50 $2,312.50
31 511 Skyweight Waterproof Side Zip Boot 12321 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.35 $4,567.50 No Bid No Bid $98.50 $4,925.00
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32 Under Armor Mirage 3.0 1287351 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.87 $5,487.00 $62.99 $6,299.00 $62.50 $6,250.00
33 Under Armor Valsetz Boot 1250234 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.65 $7,765.00 $89.50 $8,950.00 $88.50 $8,850.00
34 Bates GX-8 Side Zip w/ Goretex E02268 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.89 $3,944.50 $85.71 $4,285.50 $110.00 $5,500.00
35 Bates 8" Tactical Sport Side Zip E02261 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.72 $3,486.00 $71.43 $3,571.50 $75.00 $3,750.00
36 Bates 5" Tactical Sport Boot E02262 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.78 $3,139.00 $64.29 $3,214.50 $67.00 $3,350.00
37 Thorogood High Gloss Academy Shoe 831-6031 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.77 $4,777.00 $47.00 $4,700.00
38 Bates Men's Durashock High Gloss Oxford E00111 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.50 $1,750.00 $92.14 $1,842.80 $95.50 $1,910.00
39 Bates Women's Durashock High Gloss Oxford E00742 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.50 $437.50 $92.14 $460.70 $95.50 $477.50
40 Bates 2 Pack of Socks E11917170 100 No Bid No Bid $140.22 $14,022.00 No Bid No Bid $8.57 $857.00 $8.50 $850.00

41 Safariland Level III SSIII Mid Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 070-83-91/92 20 No Bid No Bid $140.22 $2,804.40 $125.28 $2,505.60 No Bid No Bid $154.00 $3,080.00
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42 Safariland Level III SSIII Low Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 0705-83-91/92 20 No Bid No Bid $138.17 $2,763.40 $125.28 $2,505.60 No Bid No Bid $154.00 $3,080.00

43 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 6360-83-91/92 20 No Bid No Bid $138.17 $2,763.40 $123.17 $2,463.40 No Bid No Bid $152.00 $3,040.00

44 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride High Gloss Holster, No 
Substitutions 6365-83-91/92 20 No Bid No Bid $100.55 $2,011.00 $123.17 $2,463.40 No Bid No Bid $152.00 $3,040.00

45 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster, No Substitutions 6360-83-131/132 20 No Bid No Bid $100.55 $2,011.00 $91.67 $1,833.40 No Bid No Bid $111.00 $2,220.00

46 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster, No Substitutions 6365-83-131/132 20 No Bid No Bid $148.43 $2,968.60 $91.67 $1,833.40 No Bid No Bid $111.00 $2,220.00

47 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride High Gloss Holster to Fit 
Gun Light, No Substitutions 6360-832-91/92 20 No Bid No Bid $148.43 $2,968.60 $132.32 $2,646.40 No Bid No Bid $163.00 $3,260.00

48 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride High Gloss Holster to Fit 
Gun Light, No Substitutions 6365-832-91/92 10 No Bid No Bid $110.81 $1,108.10 $132.32 $1,323.20 No Bid No Bid $163.00 $1,630.00

49 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 6360-832-131/132 10 No Bid No Bid $110.81 $1,108.10 $101.02 $1,010.20 No Bid No Bid $122.00 $1,220.00

50 Safariland Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride STX Tactical Finish 
Holster to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 6365-832-131/132 20 No Bid No Bid $100.55 $2,011.00 $101.02 $2,020.40 No Bid No Bid $122.00 $2,440.00

51 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride Plain Finish Holster, 
No Substitutions 7360-83-411/412 100 No Bid No Bid $100.55 $10,055.00 $91.67 $9,167.00 No Bid No Bid $111.00 $11,100.00

52 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride Plain Finish Holster, 
No Substitutions 7365-83-411/412 25 No Bid No Bid $110.81 $2,770.25 $91.67 $2,291.75 No Bid No Bid $111.00 $2,775.00

53 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Mid Ride Plain Finish Holster 
to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 7360-832-411/412 50 No Bid No Bid $110.81 $5,540.50 $101.02 $5,051.00 No Bid No Bid $122.00 $6,100.00

54 Safariland 7TS Level III ALS/SLS Low Ride Plain Finish Holster 
to Fit Gun Light, No Substitutions 7365-832-411/412 25 No Bid No Bid $148.43 $3,710.75 $101.02 $2,525.50 No Bid No Bid $122.00 $3,050.00

55 Safariland 6385 ALS OMV Tactical Holster Available in multiple 
colors, No Substitutions

6385-832-131/132-
SP10 15 No Bid No Bid $138.17 $2,072.55 $132.32 $1,984.80 No Bid No Bid $163.00 $2,445.00

56 Safariland 7TS ALS Tactical Holster Available in multiple colors, 
No Substitutions

7385-832-131/132-
SP10 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.17 $1,231.70 No Bid No Bid $152.00 $1,520.00

57 Flying Cross 100% Wool Uniform Men's Trousers, price to 
include hemming, No Substitutions 32289 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.99 $5,499.00 $96.70 $9,670.00

58 Flying Cross 100% Wool Uniform Women's Trousers price to 
include hemming, No Substitutions 32289W 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.99 $1,324.75 $92.75 $2,318.75

59 Flying Cross 100% Wool Men's Short Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 70R95 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.99 $4,999.00 $89.50 $8,950.00

60 Flying Cross 100% Wool Women's Short Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 170R95 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.99 $1,249.75 $85.75 $2,143.75

61 Flying Cross 100% Wool Men's Long Sleeve Shirt w/ Department 
Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 20W95 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.75 $5,575.00 $93.83 $9,383.00

62 Flying Cross 100% Wool Women's Long Sleeve Shirt w/ 
Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 120W95 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.99 $1,374.75 $92.25 $2,306.25

63 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Uniform Men's Trousers 
price to include hemming, No Substitutions 47280 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.99 $6,399.00 $78.10 $7,810.00

64 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Uniform Women's 
Trousers price to include hemming, No Substitutions 47280W 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.99 $1,599.75 $74.75 $1,868.75

65
Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Men's Short Sleeve Shirt 
w/ Zippers and w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No 
Substitutions

57R84Z 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.99 $5,399.00 $67.00 $6,700.00
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66 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Women's Short Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 157R84 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.99 $1,399.75 $59.75 $1,493.75

67
Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Men's Long Sleeve Shirt 
with Zippers  and w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No 
Substitutions

07W84Z 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.99 $5,999.00 $78.83 $7,883.00

68 Flying Cross 75% Polyester/25% Wool Women's Long Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeves, No Substitutions 107W84 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.99 $1,549.75 $67.25 $1,681.25

69 Vertx Phantom LT 2.0 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Pant, 
hemmed, No Substitutions VTX8001 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.99 $7,998.00 $37.50 $7,500.00

70 Vertx Phantom LT 2.0 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Women's 
Pant, hemmed, No Substitutions VTX8051 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.99 $1,999.50 $35.75 $1,787.50
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72
Vertx Phantom LT 65/35 Polyester/Cotton Ripstop Long Sleeve 
Shirt w/ Department Patches on Both Sleeve and Badge Tab, No 
Substitutions

VTX8120 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.99 $3,749.25 $47.00 $3,525.00

73 511 Apex Pants, No Substitutions 74434 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.00 $20,800.00

74
Spiewak windproof, Water proof Soft Shell Jacket w/ Department 
Patches on both Sleeves, Department Badge Patch Left Chest, 
and Custom Name Tape Left Chest, No Substitutions 

S318Z 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $97.99 $9,799.00 $100.38 $10,038.00

75

Spiewak windproof, Water proof Soft Shell Jacket with chest and 
sleeve pockets, Department Patches on both Sleeves, 
Department Badge Patch Left Chest, and Custom Name Tape 
Left Chest, No Substitutions 

S318ZX 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $107.99 $5,399.50 $113.63 $5,681.50

76 Keystone Uniform Dress Cap with two Horizontal Eyelets, No 
Substitutions R10 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.99 $6,799.00 $43.00 $4,300.00

77 Samuel Broome Clip on Navy Tie in Regular and Long Lengths 450 125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25 $406.25 $3.25 $406.25

78 Spiewak ANSI 2 Traffic Vest w/ Custom Black Lettering, TULSA 
POLICE Vertically added to the front and back S912 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.99 $3,999.00 $46.00 $4,600.00

79 Richarson Flex Fit Dark Navy Hat w/ Department Logo 
Embroidered on the front, No Substitutions 500S5 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.75 $2,750.00 $17.00 $3,400.00

80 Adding Badge Number or Last Name to the back of the Ballcap Optional Hat 
Embroidery 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.25 $637.50 $6.25 $937.50

81 Port Authority Watch Cap, No Substitutions CP90 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.50 $1,275.00 $1.85 $277.50
82 Stratton Navy Straw Campaign Hat S-40DB 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.99 $1,999.75 $62.00 $1,550.00
83 Black Name Plate with White Lettering Name Plate 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 $950.00 $6.50 $650.00

84 Smith & Warren Gol-Ray Tulsa PD Badge w/ a Custom Seal, 
Lifetime Warranty, and free refinishing, No Substitutions S42A Gol-Ray 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.67 $7,667.00 $61.99 $6,199.00 $75.00 $7,500.00

85 Monadnock X2 26" Baton Kit that includes 26" Autolock Baton, 
Wedge Cap, and Baton Holder, No Substitutions 9875 100 No Bid No Bid $65.55 $6,555.00 $124.72 $12,472.00 No Bid No Bid $137.00 $13,700.00

86 Monadnock Riot Helmet with Ear Covers, Face Shield, and 
Flexible Chin Cup, No Substitutions TR1000 100 No Bid No Bid $113.54 $11,354.00 $115.64 $11,564.00 No Bid No Bid $137.00 $13,700.00

87 Monadnock 36" Wooden Baton, No Substitutions 2800 25 No Bid No Bid $112.86 $2,821.50 $18.37 $459.25 No Bid No Bid $22.50 $562.50
88 Metal Radio Clip to fit XTS5000 M-X5000 100 No Bid No Bid $18.47 $1,847.00 No Bid No Bid $34.25 $3,425.00 $29.50 $2,950.00
89 Saunders Form Holder, No Substitutions 12201 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.18 $1,718.00 $12.99 $1,299.00 $18.00 $1,800.00
90 Saunders Ticket Book Holder, No Substitutions 10003 100 No Bid No Bid $22.09 $2,209.00 $13.96 $1,396.00 $19.99 $1,999.00 $15.00 $1,500.00
91 Bear Aide Pocket Traffic Template, No Substitutions 6133-34 100 No Bid No Bid $19.45 $1,945.00 No Bid No Bid $11.99 $1,199.00 $10.50 $1,050.00

92 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 75810 5 $82.68 $413.40 $9.75 $48.75 $75.78 $378.90 $89.99 $449.95 $93.00 $465.00

93 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ AC Charger, No Substitutions 75811 10 $99.75 $997.50 $86.24 $862.40 $91.40 $914.00 $109.99 $1,099.90 $112.00 $1,120.00

94 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ DC Charger, No Substitutions 75812 10 $93.95 $939.50 $104.43 $1,044.30 $86.18 $861.80 $99.99 $999.90 $105.50 $1,055.00

95 Streamlight Stinger DS LED w/ AC & DC Chargers, No 
Substitutions 75813 10 $111.50 $1,115.00 $98.09 $980.90 $101.82 $1,018.20 $112.99 $1,129.90 $125.00 $1,250.00

96 Streamlight Stinger DS LED HL w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 75453 10 $95.08 $950.80 $115.88 $1,158.80 $87.14 $871.40 $96.49 $964.90 $107.00 $1,070.00
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97 Streamlight Stinger DS LED HL w/ Two Chargers, No 
Substitutions 75454 10 $124.50 $1,245.00 $99.17 $991.70 $117.09 $1,170.90 $129.99 $1,299.90 $143.50 $1,435.00

98 Streamlight TLR1 High Lumen Gun Light, No Substitutions 69260 100 $119.50 $11,950.00 $133.27 $13,327.00 $111.93 $11,193.00 $124.99 $12,499.00 $137.00 $13,700.00

99 Streamlight Strion LED w/o Chargers, No Substitutions 74300 5 $64.95 $324.75 $127.38 $636.90 $59.77 $298.85 $69.99 $349.95 $73.00 $365.00

100 Streamlight Strion LED w/ One AC/DC Charger, No Substitutions 74301 10 $93.50 $935.00 $68.02 $680.20 $85.52 $855.20 $993.99 $9,939.90 $105.00 $1,050.00

101 Streamlight Strion LED w/ Two AC/DC Charger, No Substitutions 74302 100 $110.95 $11,095.00 $90.50 $9,050.00 $101.61 $10,161.00 $109.99 $10,999.00 $124.50 $12,450.00

102 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light No Chargers, 
No Substitutions 74610 10 $82.50 $825.00 $115.65 $1,156.45 $105.11 $1,051.10 $96.99 $969.90 $92.50 $925.00

103 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light One AC/DC 
Charger, No Substitutions 74611 10 $114.50 $1,145.00 $85.92 $859.20 $123.61 $1,236.10 $119.99 $1,199.90 $129.00 $1,290.00

104 Streamlight Strion Dual Switch High Lumen Light Two AC/DC 
Chargers, No Substitutions 74612 10 $132.95 $1,329.50 $119.62 $1,196.20 $976.95 $9,769.50 $121.99 $1,219.90 $151.50 $1,515.00

105 Avon C50 APR Gas Mask, No Substitutions 70501 10 No Bid No Bid $140.68 $1,406.80 $41.27 $412.70 $434.99 $4,349.90 $284.00 $2,840.00
106 Avon Clear Outsert Assembly, No Substitutions 70501-156 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.40 $504.00 $49.99 $499.90 No Bid No Bid
107 Avon CBRN Filter, No Substitutions 72602-2 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.40 $254.00 $159.99 $1,599.90 $66.50 $665.00
108 Avon Universal Carrier, No Substitutions 70501-227 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.29 $142.90 $45.00 $450.00 $48.00 $480.00
109 Avon Storage Faceform, No Substitutions 72601 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.94 $1,609.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

110 Avon CTCF50 Riot Agent Cannister Four Pack, No Substitutions 72606-3 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $541.71 $27,085.50 $164.99 $8,249.50 $76.00 $3,800.00

TSC Distributing., LLC 
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111

Avon C50 First Responder Kit which includes C50 Mask, Clear 
Outsert, Sunlight outsert, CBRN Canister, CTCF50 Riot 
Canister, Universal Carrier, and Storage Faceform, No 
Substitutions

70501-55X 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $649.99 $64,999.00 $282.00 $28,200.00

112 Sabre Red 10%, 1.8oz Cone Spray, No Substitutions 521010-C 250 No Bid No Bid $9.96 $2,490.00 No Bid No Bid $9.99 $2,497.50 $11.25 $2,812.50
113 Sabre Red Inert 1.6oz Cone Spray, No Substitutions 50H201010-C 100 No Bid No Bid $8.76 $876.00 No Bid No Bid $8.25 $825.00 $9.25 $925.00
114 Sabre Red 10% Stream Spray, No Substitutions 52H2ONY-BK 250 No Bid No Bid $8.76 $2,190.00 No Bid No Bid $9.25 $2,312.50 $9.00 $2,250.00
115 Smith & Wesson Nickle Chained Handcuffs 100 100 No Bid No Bid $21.33 $2,133.00 $22.03 $2,203.00 $21.25 $2,125.00 $21.00 $2,100.00
116 Smith & Wesson Nickle Hinged Handcuffs 300 25 No Bid No Bid $31.95 $798.75 $27.47 $686.75 $26.75 $668.75 $24.50 $612.50
117 Streamlight Lithium Battery 85179-1 500 No Bid No Bid $2.16 $1,080.00 $1.36 $680.00 $1.50 $750.00 $1.50 $750.00

$414,341.75$174,319.30 $241,448.50$33,265.45 $270,958.20TOTAL EXTENDED COST 
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