) Tulsa

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department

175 E. 2nd St. #575 TAC601F
Copper Sulfate

Tulsa, OK 74103 Open Date 09/06/2017

Terry O. Thomas, Senior Buyer
tthomas@cityoftulsa.org

Please contact
if you have any

Item [Description Estimated Annual Qty. Alpine Technical Services BioSafe Systems, LLC
(55 gallon drum)
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate Green Clean Liquid
1 Mohawk Water Treatment Plant 75 Earthec $1,605.85 $120,438.75 50 $550.00 $41,250.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate Green Clean Liquid
2 AB Jewell Water Treatment Plant 75 Earthec $1,605.85 $120,438.75 50 $550.00 $41,250.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate Green Clean Liquid
3 Spavinaw Water Treatment Plant 75 Earthec $1,605.85 $120,438.75 50 $550.00 $41,250.00
Total $361,316.25 $123,750.00
Price requires minimum purchase of 32 drums
Item |Description Estimated Annual Qty. Chem-A-Co Inc. Sterling Water Technologies, LLC
(55 gallon drum)
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate i
1 Mohawk Water Treatment Plant 75 $507.10 $38,032.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate i
2 AB Jewell Water Treatment Plant 75 $507.10 $38,032.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate i
3 Spavinaw Water Treatment Plant 75 $507.10 $38,032.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Total $114,097.50 $0.00
Item |Description Estimated Annual Qty. Mid-Anerica Hydro Tech Univar USA Inc.
(55 gallon drum)
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate )
1 |Mohawk Water Treatment Plant 75 EarthTec $535.70 $40,177.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate )
2 | AB Jewell Water Treatment Plant 75 EarthTec $535.70 $40,177.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Copper Sulfate Pentahydrate )
3 Spavinaw Water Treatment Plant 75 EarthTec $535.70 $40,177.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
Total $120,532.50 $0.00

Price requires minimum purchase of 32 drums
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