YTulsa

A New Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department IFB 18-929 Buyer: Larry Riddle

175 E. 2nd Street #575 LED LIGHTING Iriddle@cityoftulsa.org

Tulsa, OK 74103 WATER & SEWER DEPARTMENT Please contact if you have any questions
Bid Date: July 12, 2018 918-596-7558

1. Delivery:

If your bid is accepted and a contract is exucuted, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing collection under
any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Lights on America Inc Telecom Elecric Supply Company Fastenal Company Rexel USA dba Rexel

- Estim Annual . . . :
Item Description S“Ql?;tity ua Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

EXTERIOR LIGHTING FOR GRAND, CANYON LAKE,

AND BIRD CREEK PUMP STATIONS: 400 EQUAL WALL,
1 WML 120NW LG, 7 $89.99 $629.93 $229.98 $1,609.86 $228.12 $1,596.84 $210.00 $1,470.00

EXTERIOR LIGHTING FOR GRAND LAKE PUMP
2 STATION. 70 WAT EQUAL, WML 30 NW 4 $59.99 $239.96 $74.70 $298.80 $82.52 $330.08 $75.00 $300.00

EXTERIOR LIGHTING EOR CANYON LAKE AND WOODS
3 PUMP STATIONS. DUSK TO DAWN LR2 50 CW P 4 No Bid No Bid $113.00 $452.00 $121.77 $487.08 $112.00 $448.00

INTERIOR LIGHTING FOR BIRD CREEK, CANYON LAKE,
WOODS PUMP STATIONS: HIGH BAYS:
HEU7MC2BNNWNGN-"BIGILANT HIGH BAY, NO
OPTIONS, MEDIUM, 14250 LUMENS, 102 WATTS, 100-
227 VAC, COOL WHITE 5000K, GLASS-CLEAR, GRAY,
10' (BMETER) POWER CABLE, (UL 1598/A)"), PER
SPECIFICATION ABOVE

52 $89.99 $4,679.48 $980.00 $50,960.00 $1,565.48 $81,404.96 $775.00 $40,300.00

INTERIOR LIGHTING FOR GRAND LANKE PUMP
STATION IN BASEMENT: LTM3C4M2P-DUROSITE
LINEAR-GEN 11, 7250 LUMENS, 66 WATTS, 100-277V
AC, COOL WHITE, CLEAR POLYCARBONATE LENS
PER SPECIFICATION ABOVE.

12 No Bid No Bid $440.40 $5,284.80 $701.90 $8,422.80 $352.00 $4,224.00

INTERIOR LIGHTING FOR LAKE PUMP STATION;
HEU7MC2CNNWNG-VIGILANT HIGH BAY, NO OPTIONS,
MEDIUM, 19500 LUMENS, 129 WATTS, 100-277 VAC,

6 COOL WITE 5000K, GLASS-CLEAR, GRAY, 10" (3 16 $99.99 $1,599.84 $1,128.15 $18,050.40 $1,802.02 $28,832.32 $897.00 $14,352.00
METER) POWER CABLE, (UL 1598/A) PER
SPECIFICATION ABOVE

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: $7.149.21 $76,655.86 $121,074.08 $61,094.00

(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

Lead Times: Item #1, #2 & #3 -2

DELIVERY: 60-90 DAYS 8 -10 WEEKS weeks, Item #4 - 9 weeks, Item #5 - 4 to 8 WEEKS
4 weeks, Items #6 - 7 weeks
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